

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 121

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Revised new draft of First Chicago settlement proposal (.3).	FIRST CHICAGO			
450986	TIME		3/5/2010 WIP Conference with Adam at SecureTek re: obtaining email backup tapes for litigation (.2); emails to and from R. Elli and S. Herndon re: same (.2); conference with M. Schwartz re: demand letter to SecureTec (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
451294	TIME		3/8/2010 WIP Revise draft of response to First Chicago settlement proposal	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
451301	TIME		3/8/2010 WIP Emails to and from D. Leibowitz re: First Chicago settlement proposal (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
451376	TIME		3/9/2010 WIP Email to J. Sieger re: settlement proposal	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
453433	TIME		3/9/2010 WIP Revise response to first Chicago settlement offer	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.30 0.00	245.00 T@13	73.50
452080	TIME		3/16/2010 WIP Discuss FCB response to settlement with A. Guon	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	95.00
452067	TIME		3/16/2010 WIP Conference with P. Barr and W. Dorsey re: settlement and related issues (.2); analysis of First Chicago third party issues (.3); conference with P. Barr re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00
468571	TIME		3/17/2010 WIP Email to B. Purcell re: First Chicago request (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 122

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
452338	TIME 3/19/2010 WIP Analysis of issues re: FC's request to file cross-claim (.8); emails to and from D. Leibowitz re: same (.3); conference with W. Dorsey re: same (.3); conference with I. Bodenstein re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	570.00
452379	TIME 3/19/2010 WIP Discuss FC's request for consent to bring malpractice counterclaim with A. Guon and R. Fishman.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
454342	TIME 4/1/2010 WIP Examined FC's motion for leave to file third party complaint (.6); reviewed FC security agreement (.3); analysis of issues re: leave to file malpractice complaint (1.0); conference with J. Guzzardo re: researching issues related to motion (.3)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.90 0.00	380.00 T@13	722.00
454348	TIME 4/1/2010 WIP Review First Chicago Motion for Leave to File Third Party Complaint and attached complaint against Lowis and Gellen (.7); discuss with A. Guon and D. Goodman (.3).	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.00 0.00	475.00 T@13	475.00
455717	TIME 4/7/2010 WIP Court appearance re: First Chicago's motion for leave to file third party complaint.	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
455469	TIME 4/7/2010 WIP Conference with W. Dorsey re: settlement and motion for leave to file third party complaint (.3); conference with M. Schwartz re: research third party complaint issues (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
455987	TIME 4/12/2010 WIP Examined case law re: malpractice actions (.6); analysis of issues re: same (.3); conference with W. Dorsey re: motion for leave and settlement (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.30 0.20	380.00 T@13	494.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 123

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
456164	TIME		4/13/2010 WIP Court appearance re: First Chicago motion for leave (.8)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	304.00
456620	TIME		4/15/2010 WIP Prepare initial disclosures for First Chicago action	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.90 0.00	245.00 T@13	465.50
456426	TIME		4/15/2010 WIP Examined order granting leave to file third-party complaint	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
456829	TIME		4/19/2010 WIP Examined First Chicago initial disclosures.	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
457274	TIME		4/23/2010 WIP Review Motion to Dismiss 3rd party complaint	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
457432	TIME		4/26/2010 WIP Examined L&G motion to dismiss (.3); conference with M. Schwartz re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
459621	TIME		4/29/2010 WIP Prepare for and attend hearing setting briefing schedule for Third Party Complaint. (1.1)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.10 0.00	245.00 T@13	269.50
457855	TIME		4/29/2010 WIP Conference with I. Bodenstein re: notice of appeal (.2); conference with J. Brand re: same (.1); analysis of issues re: responding to appeal (.3)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00
459624	TIME		4/30/2010 WIP Draft First Chicago discovery requests	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	3.20 0.00	245.00 T@13	784.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 124

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
458838	TIME			AJG	1.00	380.00	380.00
	5/4/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Reviewed and revised first set of discovery to First Chicago (1.0)	FIRST CHICAGO			
464283	TIME			MLS	2.10	245.00	514.50
	5/12/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Draft First Chicago discovery request.	FIRST CHICAGO			
464286	TIME			MLS	1.20	245.00	294.00
	5/13/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Revise First Chicago discovery request.	FIRST CHICAGO			
460555	TIME			TGB	1.10	380.00	418.00
	5/13/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Reviewed and edited discovery to First Chicago and conferred with M. Schwartz re same.	FIRST CHICAGO			
460556	TIME			TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
	5/13/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Reviewed objection to Lewis & Gellen motion to dismiss.	FIRST CHICAGO			
460485	TIME			IB	0.40	475.00	190.00
	5/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review FCB objection to Lewis and Gellen motion to dismiss	FIRST CHICAGO			
460636	TIME			AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
	5/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with R. Hedges and I. Bodenstein re: investigation (.2).	FIRST CHICAGO			
461358	TIME			TGB	0.10	380.00	38.00
	5/21/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Considered First Chicago discovery requests to Trustee.	FIRST CHICAGO			
461549	TIME			AJG	0.80	380.00	304.00
	5/24/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Examined case law re: preference defenses and claims (.8)	FIRST CHICAGO			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 125

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity	Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
461582	5/25/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with J. Brand re: today's status hearing	AJG Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
464325	5/25/2010	TIME	WIP E-mail to R. Elli First Chicago's discovery request	MLS Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	0.20 0.00	245.00 T@13	49.00
462751	5/31/2010	TIME	WIP Review Lewis & Gellen Reply Brief re: motion to dismiss	IB Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
464194	6/3/2010	TIME	WIP Examined reply in support of Lewis & Gellen motion to dismiss (.4); emails to and from T. Banich re: discovery issues (.3).	AJG Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	0.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	266.00
464397	6/3/2010	TIME	WIP Coordinating response to discovery request with R. Elli.	MLS Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	0.30 0.00	245.00 T@13	73.50
466095	6/8/2010	TIME	WIP Call with R. Elli re Discovery Responses (.4); meeting w/ T. Banich re discovery responses (.3)	MLS Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	0.70 0.00	245.00 T@13	171.50
464777	6/8/2010	TIME	WIP Consider motion to strike affirmative defenses, possible Rule 11 letter re perfection issue and document requests to Lewis & Gellen re perfection issues.	TGB Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
464559	6/8/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with M. Schwartz re: results from motion to dismiss hearing (.2); reviewed First Chicago answer and third party complaint (.3); conference with M. Schwartz and T. Banich re: litigation strategy and discovery issues (.5)	AJG Legal Services	FIRST CHICAGO	1.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	380.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 126

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
464787	TIME			TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
	6/10/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conferred with M. Schwartz re responses to First Chicago's discovery requests.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO			
466106	TIME			MLS	1.10	245.00	269.50
	6/11/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Draft subpoena for Lewis & Gellen	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO			
464839	TIME			AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
	6/11/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Examined First Chicago's response to motion to supplement record on motion to dismiss hearing (.2); reviewed and revised subpoena to Lewis & Gellen (.3).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO			
466110	TIME			MLS	5.10	245.00	1249.50
	6/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Review IFC document request and revise Lewis & Gellen subpoena (1.1); draft motion to strike First Chicago's affirmative defenses (4.)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO			
465432	TIME			TGB	0.50	380.00	190.00
	6/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Reviewed and edited subpoena rider to Lewis & Gellen re First Chicago perfection issues.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO			
465434	TIME			TGB	0.70	380.00	266.00
	6/15/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Reviewed and edited motion to strike First Chicago's affirmative defenses and conferred with M. Schwartz re same.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO			
465160	TIME			AJG	2.80	380.00	1064.00
	6/16/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Reviewed and revised motion to strike affirmative defenses (.8); addressed issues related to response to First Chicago discovery (.9); conference with R. Elli re: same (.2); conference with C. Berman re: subpoena (.3); prepared new subpoena and notice of subpoena (.6).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO			
466273	TIME			JWG	0.70	290.00	203.00
	6/16/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 127

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Assistance with answers to interrogatories in First Chicago preference litigation.	FIRST CHICAGO			
465448	TIME		6/16/2010 WIP Considered additional arguments in support of motion to strike First Chicago's affirmative defenses, drafted, edited, finalized and filed same (2.2); attended to responses to First Chicago's discovery requests to trustee (1.0).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	3.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	1216.00
465372	TIME		6/18/2010 WIP Confer with T. Banich regarding research on whether 26(f) report is stayed (.1); Conduct Westlaw research on deferring Rule 26(f) report until motions to dismiss are resolved and review and analyze cases regarding same (1.2)	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	377.00
466126	TIME		6/21/2010 WIP Draft response to first Chicago discovery request.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	3.30 0.00	245.00 T@13	808.50
465489	TIME		6/21/2010 WIP Conference with T. Banich and W. Dorsey re: settlement and discovery (.3); conference with M. Schwartz and T. Banich re: responses to First Chicago discovery (.3); reviewed transcript from Lewis & Gellen's motion to dismiss (.5).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	1.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	418.00
466127	TIME		6/22/2010 WIP Draft response to first Chicago discovery request.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	2.50 0.00	245.00 T@13	612.50
466314	TIME		6/23/2010 WIP Edits and drafting of First Chicago discovery response in preference action.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	3.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	928.00
466192	TIME		6/23/2010 WIP Conferred with M. Schwartz re response to First Chicago discovery requests (.2); conferred with J. Guzzardo re same (.1).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 128

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
466323	TIME			JWG	6.40	290.00	1856.00
	6/24/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Edits to and research for preference action discovery response.	FIRST CHICAGO			
465938	TIME			AJG	0.40	380.00	152.00
	6/24/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with M. Schwartz and J. Guzzardo re: discovery response revisions.	FIRST CHICAGO			
466199	TIME			TGB	1.40	380.00	532.00
	6/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Attended to First Chicago discovery issues.	FIRST CHICAGO			
466332	TIME			JWG	4.60	290.00	1334.00
	6/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Edits to and drafting of responses to First Chicago discovery requests.	FIRST CHICAGO			
466007	TIME			AJG	1.20	380.00	456.00
	6/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with J. Guzzardo re: discovery issues (.3); reviewed and analyzed issues related to draft discovery responses (.5); conference with J. Brand re: extension of discovery deadlines (.1); conference with W. Dorsey re: same (.3).	FIRST CHICAGO			
466130	TIME			MLS	5.10	245.00	1249.50
	6/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Draft response to first Chicago discovery request.	FIRST CHICAGO			
466097	TIME			AJG	1.20	380.00	456.00
	6/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with J. Guzzardo re: discovery issues (.3); reviewed and analyzed issues related to draft discovery responses (.5); conference with J. Brand re: extension of discovery deadlines (.1); conference with W. Dorsey re: same (.3).	FIRST CHICAGO			
468603	TIME			JWG	1.30	290.00	377.00
	6/28/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Discussion with M. Schwartz re: First Chicago discovery responses. (.5) Review of draft of same. (.8)	FIRST CHICAGO			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 129

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
466217	6/28/2010	WIP	Examined order dismissing third-party complaint against L&G (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
467604	6/29/2010	WIP	Considered First Chicago discovery issues.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
466485	6/29/2010	WIP	Meeting w/ J. Guzzardo and M. Herman re document review (.5); document review and revise response to document request (2.3)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	2.80 0.00	245.00 T@13	686.00
468616	6/30/2010	WIP	Review of draft responses to First Chicago discovery requests and follow up edits. (.5)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR FIRST CHICAGO	0.50 0.00	290.00 T@13	145.00
Total: FIRST CHICAGO				Billable	131.60		43572.00
				Unbillable	0.20		76.00
				Total	131.80		43648.00
<u>Nickname 1: GENERAL LIFT STAY MOTIONS</u>							
467229	11/2/2009	WIP	Reviewed lift stay motion filed by Nichols (.6); examined WSB lift stay motion (.3); prepared response to WSB and Nichols lift stay motion (.8)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	1.70 0.00	365.00 T@14	620.50
467238	11/5/2009	WIP	Examined correspondence from B. Barrett re: WSB's response to demand letter (.1); e-mail to B. Purcell re: sale of paper dryers (.1); conference with B. Pucell re: sale of dryers and lift WSB stay motion (.3); conference with R. Elli re: First Chicago lease issues and dryer sale (.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.90 0.00	365.00 T@14	328.50
467249	11/9/2009	WIP	Conference with B. Purcell re: Ludwig and Nichols	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.70 0.00	365.00 T@14	255.50

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 130

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			lift stay motions and coordination of strategy for sale of assets (.4); conference with J. Brand re: same (.3)				
437142	TIME			AJG	0.20	365.00	73.00
	12/1/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with counsel for WSB and Nichols re: dryer lift stay motion (.2).	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
439627	TIME			IB	0.20	465.00	93.00
	12/17/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review Wheeling lift stay motion	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
442684	TIME			AJG	0.90	380.00	342.00
	1/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with B. Purcell re: status of dryer investigation (.1); court appearance re: Nichols motion for relief (.8)	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
442823	TIME			AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	1/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Examined US Banks proposed stipulation re: relief from stay (.1).	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
445094	TIME			AJG	0.70	380.00	266.00
	1/29/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Examined proposed stay relief stipulation from US Bank (.1); conference with A. Rhim re: lift stay stipulation and related lease issues (.5); e-mail to D. Leibowitz re: same (.1).	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
445144	TIME			IB	0.20	475.00	95.00
	1/29/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review stay relief stipulation with US Bank	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
447536	TIME			AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	2/1/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Examined e-mail from A. Rhim re: PFP leasing lift stay proposed order (.1)	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
448942	TIME			AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	2/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Email from J. Alwin and to B. Purcell re: Dryer lift stay and sale issues (.1).	GENERAL LIFT STAY			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 131

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
451149	TIME		3/8/2010 WIP Conference with J. Brand re: NorthSide lift stay motion (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
451382	TIME		3/9/2010 WIP Conference with D. Leibowitz re: Iron Horse lift stay motion (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
451380	TIME		3/9/2010 WIP Email correspondence with Michael Small and A. Guon regarding status of West Suburban stay relief motion.	GEG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	58.00
452195	TIME		3/17/2010 WIP Conference with J. Brand re Dryer lift stay motion (.2); email to and from J. Alwin re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
452260	TIME		3/18/2010 WIP Court appearance re: WSB and Nichols motion for relief from stay (.8).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	304.00
468573	TIME		3/19/2010 WIP Email to B. Purcell re: Dryer leases (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
452705	TIME		3/22/2010 WIP Email from R. Elli re: Dryer issues (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
453905	TIME		3/30/2010 WIP Review Lakeside Bank Lift Stay Motion	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	95.00
454068	TIME		3/31/2010 WIP Examined Lakeside Bank's motion for relief from stay (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR GENERAL LIFT STAY	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 132

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
460710	TIME	AJG	0.40	380.00	152.00
5/17/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with J. Alwin re: lift stay motion on Dryers (.2); email to J. Brand re: same (.1); conference with J. Brand re: continuance (.1).	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
461363	TIME	AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
5/19/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with J. Brand re: VanDen Heuvel (.1); examined email re: same (.1).	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
466123	TIME	AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
6/25/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with B. Factor re: Dryers (.2).	GENERAL LIFT STAY			
Total: GENERAL LIFT STAY MOTIONS					
		Billable	8.70		3290.50
		Unbillable	0.00		0.00
		Total	8.70		3290.50
<u>Nickname 1: JURISDICTIONAL APPEALS</u>					
437075	TIME	AJG	0.70	365.00	255.50
11/30/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with D.Liebowitz, I. Bodenstein and J. Guzzardo re: filing of sur-reply (.4); examined and revised draft surreply and motion for authority to file same (.3).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
440673	TIME	TGB	0.40	365.00	146.00
12/28/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Reviewed notice of appeal and drafted correspondence re potential appellate jurisdiction issues.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
440571	TIME	AJG	2.10	365.00	766.50
12/29/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined case law re: interlocutory appeal of order denying motion to dismiss (.5); conference with P. Roberts re: motion to dismiss appeal (.4); examined bankruptcy appellate rules for appeal procedures and deadlines (1.1); e-mail to and from D. Leibowitz re: same (.1).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 133

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
441679	TIME		12/29/2009 WIP Review of First Chicago appeal of Motion to Dismiss and legal research regarding final judgments. (.5.3)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	5.30 0.00	270.00 T@14	1431.00
440674	TIME		12/29/2009 WIP Reviewed legal research pertaining to finality of orders denying motion to dismiss bankruptcy cases and considered appellate strategies pertaining to same.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.00 0.00	365.00 T@14	365.00
440556	TIME		12/29/2009 WIP Consider appellate procedure issues in connection with motion to dismiss case and confer with A. Guon on same.	PJR Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.40 0.00	440.00 T@14	176.00
441270	TIME		12/30/2009 WIP Reviewed motion for leave to appeal and memorandum in support of same (.5); telephone conference with A. Guon re appellate jurisdiction issues, response to same and re potential motion to dismiss (.3).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.80 0.00	365.00 T@14	292.00
440912	TIME		12/30/2009 WIP Review First Chicago Notice of Appeal	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.10 0.00	465.00 T@14	46.50
443578	TIME		1/4/2010 WIP Legal research and review of materials in connection with First Chicago's appeal of Motion to Dismiss. (3.5) Discussion with I. Bodenstein and A. Guon regarding Motion to Dismiss appeal and setting strategies and go forwards for same. (.8)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	4.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	1247.00
441696	TIME		1/4/2010 WIP Conferred with A. Guon and J. Guzzardo re First Chicago appeal issues and strategies.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 134

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
442923	TIME	IB	0.50	475.00	237.50
1/4/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review first Chicago Motion for Leave to Appeal		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
445174	TIME	AJG	1.60	380.00	608.00
1/4/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with J. Guzzardo re: answer to motion for leave to appeal (.4); examined transcript from December 16 hearing on motion to dismiss (.9); examined Askounis motion for leave to amend motion to dismiss (.3)		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
443737	TIME	JWG	2.40	290.00	696.00
1/5/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Legal research in connection with First Chicago ("FC") appeal of order denying motion to dismiss.		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
445184	TIME	AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
1/6/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with J. Sieger re: status of case and pending appeal of motion to dismiss (.3)		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
443750	TIME	JWG	1.30	290.00	377.00
1/7/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Legal research (.5) and drafting of objection to First Chicago appeal of Motion to Dismiss (.8).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
443752	TIME	JWG	6.50	290.00	1885.00
1/8/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Legal research (5.1) and drafting of opposition of appeal to Motion to Dismiss (1.4).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
443757	TIME	JWG	6.70	290.00	1943.00
1/9/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Legal research (4.2); drafting and edits to objection to appeal of First Chicago motion to dismiss (2.5).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
443758	TIME	JWG	5.90	290.00	1711.00
1/10/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Legal research (3.1); drafting and edits to objection to First Chicago appeal of Motion to dismiss ruling (2.8).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 135

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
443100	TIME 1/10/2010	AJG Legal Services	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Analysis of legal issues concerning motion to dismiss appeal (.5)				
443097	TIME 1/11/2010	AJG Legal Services	2.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	760.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Reviewed motion for leave to file interlocutory appeal (.7); reviewed and revised motion to dismiss appeal (1.3)				
443760	TIME 1/11/2010	JWG Legal Services	6.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	1827.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Legal research (2.2); drafting and edits to answer to First Chicago motion for leave to appeal to motion to dismiss (4.1).				
442746	TIME 1/11/2010	IB Legal Services	1.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	570.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Revise draft response to Motion for Leave to Appeal JURISDICTIONAL APP				
443969	TIME 1/12/2010	JWG Legal Services	7.60 0.00	290.00 T@13	2204.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Legal research, drafting and edits to Trustee's Answer to FC's Motion for leave to appeal. (7.6)				
443086	TIME 1/12/2010	AJG Legal Services	3.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	1216.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined motion for leave to appeal (.6); reviewed and revised motion to dismiss (2.6)				
442701	TIME 1/12/2010	IB Legal Services	1.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	712.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Revise draft of Response to Motion for leave to Appeal by First Chicago				
443972	TIME 1/13/2010	JWG Legal Services	5.50 0.00	290.00 T@13	1595.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Final edits to and preparation of filing of answer to FC's motion for leave to appeal.				
442380	TIME 1/13/2010	AJG Legal Services	1.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	646.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 136

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Revised motion to dismiss (1.6); conference with D. Leibowitz re: answer to interlocutory appeal (.1).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
442655	TIME			IB	0.50	475.00	237.50
	1/13/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Additional revisions to Response to motion for Leave to Appeal	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
467164	TIME			TGB	1.50	380.00	570.00
	1/13/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Reviewed and edited answer to motion for leave to appeal, motion to dismiss and motion to stay briefing schedule and conferred with A. Guon and J. Guzzardo re same (1.5)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444014	TIME			TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
	1/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Reviewed final response to motion for leave to appeal.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
442690	TIME			AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	1/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with J. Guzzardo re: the clerk's issues related to filing motion to dismiss (.1)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
443077	TIME			AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
	1/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Examined counter-designation of record on appeal (.2); e-mail to J. Guzzardo re: same (.1).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444253	TIME			JWG	3.30	290.00	957.00
	1/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review of materials and drafting of designation on appeal for FC motion to dismiss appeal.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444258	TIME			JWG	0.30	290.00	87.00
	1/18/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Edits to designation on appeal for FC motion to dismiss. (.1) Edits to demand for withdrawal letter. (.2)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
467168	TIME			TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
	1/19/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Reviewed draft designation of items for record on	JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 137

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
appeal and conferred with J. Guzzardo re same (.3)							
444273	TIME			JWG	2.20	290.00	638.00
	1/20/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review of D&A appellate materials, legal research for motion to consolidate appeals and drafting of same. (2.2)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444731	TIME			JWG	0.30	290.00	87.00
	1/21/2010			Legal Services	0.30	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR		No Charge	
			Follow up with regard to erroneous event entered into docket in designation of record.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444732	TIME			JWG	0.60	290.00	174.00
	1/21/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Coordination of attorney notice in connection with filing of designation of record. (.1) Legal research in connection with motion to consolidate appeal. (.5)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
443772	TIME			IB	0.30	475.00	142.50
	1/21/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review Appeal issues with J. Guzzardo	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444742	TIME			JWG	4.40	290.00	1276.00
	1/22/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Drafting of motion to consolidate appeals (4.0) and coordination of filing of designation of appellate record. (.4)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444577	TIME			AJG	0.40	380.00	152.00
	1/26/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Examined Askounis motion for leave to appeal order denying motion to dismiss (.4).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444613	TIME			AJG	1.10	380.00	418.00
	1/27/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Revised motion to consolidate appeals (.8); conference with J. Guzzardo re: same (.3).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
446358	TIME			JWG	3.30	290.00	957.00
	1/27/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Follow up with court regarding filing of appeal materials. (.2) Drafting of motion to consolidate appeals and demand letter for withdrawal. (3.1)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 138

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
445007	TIME	IB	0.20	475.00	95.00
1/28/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Phone call with W. Dorsey re: consolidation of appeals		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
444986	TIME	AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
1/29/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined order on briefing schedule and district court docket for motion to dismiss (.3); conference with Judge Manning's clerk re: same (.1); e-mail to and from D. Leibowitz re: same (.1).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
446372	TIME	JWG	6.30	290.00	1827.00
1/29/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Drafting of and coordination of filing of notice of motion for IFC answer to First Chicago appeal (1.1)		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
Drafting of answer to Askounis appeal (5.2)					
445449	TIME	TGB	0.50	380.00	190.00
1/29/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conferred with A. Guon re motion to dismiss appeal issues.		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
445216	TIME	IB	0.90	475.00	427.50
1/31/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Revise draft of Response to Askounis Motion to Dismiss		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
447539	TIME	AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
2/1/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined and revised draft of answer to Akounis appeal.		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
446379	TIME	JWG	2.90	290.00	841.00
2/1/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Edits to Answer to Askounis Appeal, compiling of exhibits and drafting of notice of motion for same. (2.9).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
445894	TIME	GXD	0.20	180.00	36.00
2/2/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Confer with J. Guzzardo re: designation of appellate record matter		JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 139

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
446386	TIME 2/2/2010	JWG Legal Services	0.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	87.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Coordination and compiling of exhibits for designation on appeal of Askounis appeal. (.3)				
447549	TIME 2/3/2010	AJG Legal Services	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined order from district court. JURISDICTIONAL APP				
446392	TIME 2/3/2010	JWG Legal Services	0.50 0.00	290.00 T@13	145.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Coordination of filing of motion to dismiss Askounis appeal. (.5) JURISDICTIONAL APP				
445824	TIME 2/4/2010	IB Legal Services	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review minute order re: schedule on motion to dismiss appeal and discuss with J. Guzzardo re: motion to dismiss Askounis appeal and filing notice of related case. JURISDICTIONAL APP				
446397	TIME 2/4/2010	JWG Legal Services	0.90 0.00	290.00 T@13	261.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Discussion with A. Guon re: scheduling and go forwards with Askounis and First Chicago appeals. (.4) Call with D. Liebowitz re: investigation and drafting of Trebels complaint and follow up re: same. (.5) JURISDICTIONAL APP				
446399	TIME 2/5/2010	JWG Legal Services	0.50 0.00	290.00 T@13	145.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Filing of appearances in Askounis appeal. (.5) JURISDICTIONAL APP				
446032	TIME 2/5/2010	IB Legal Services	0.20 0.20	475.00 T@13	95.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR		No Charge	
	Address Askounis appeal issues JURISDICTIONAL APP				
446534	TIME 2/7/2010	GXD Legal Services	0.50 0.00	180.00 T@13	90.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Work on designation of appellate record matters/review lists JURISDICTIONAL APP				

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 140

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
446933	2/8/2010	TIME	WIP Confer with J. Guzzardo re: designation of appellate record (.4); draft designation lists and print/download documents for same (3.4)	GXD Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	3.80 0.00	180.00 T@13	684.00
446879	2/8/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with J. Guzzardo re: transmittal of record for Askounis appeal.	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.10 0.10	380.00 T@13 No Charge	38.00
447702	2/8/2010	TIME	WIP Compiling of Askounis appeal designation of record. (.2) Review of filings in First Chicago and Askounis appeals. (.1)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	87.00
447710	2/9/2010	TIME	WIP Compiling and review of designation of record for Askounis appeal of Motion to Dismiss and collection of documents in connection with same. (.4)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.40 0.00	290.00 T@13	116.00
447381	2/10/2010	TIME	WIP Confer with J. Guzzardo and M. Carter re: appellate designation matters	GXD Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.20 0.00	180.00 T@13	36.00
447729	2/12/2010	TIME	WIP Completion of designation of record and coordination of filing of same. (.5) Review of docketed materials by FC and Askounis in appeals. (.5) Drafting of motion to consolidate appeals. (.4)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.40 0.00	290.00 T@13	406.00
447585	2/12/2010	TIME	WIP Confer with J. Guzzardo and M. Carter re: appellate designation matters (.4); revise designation list and prepared binding/filing of same (2.0)	GXD Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	2.40 0.00	180.00 T@13	432.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 141

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
447738	TIME			JWG	0.90	290.00	261.00
	2/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Drafting and edits to motion to consolidate appeals	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				JURISDICTIONAL APP			
449291	TIME			JWG	3.30	290.00	957.00
	2/16/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Drafting of motion to consolidate appeals. (2.5)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review of Askounis appeal and beginning of drafting of motion to deny leave to appeal. (.8)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
447836	TIME			GXD	0.50	180.00	90.00
	2/16/2010			Legal Services	0.10	T@13	
	WIP		Review appellate binders (.4)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				JURISDICTIONAL APP			
447932	TIME			IB	0.50	475.00	237.50
	2/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Review and comment to J. Guzzardo on Motion to Consolidate Appeals	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				JURISDICTIONAL APP			
448277	TIME			TGB	0.20	380.00	76.00
	2/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conferred with I. Bodenstein and J. Guzzardo re consolidation of appellate proceedings.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				JURISDICTIONAL APP			
447945	TIME			AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	2/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Examined coversheet filed by Askounis (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				JURISDICTIONAL APP			
448048	TIME			AJG	1.80	380.00	684.00
	2/18/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Examined Askounis appeal brief (.6); conference with W. Dorsey re motion to consolidate and stay (.2); conferences (2) with T. Askounis re: same (.2); revised motions to consolidate all three appeals (.8).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				JURISDICTIONAL APP			
449311	TIME			JWG	1.30	290.00	377.00
	2/19/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Follow up with regarding to procedural issues with motion to consolidate appeals. (.4) Review of appeal of motion to dismiss materials and discussion with I. Bodenstein and A. Guon for strategies and go-forwards in same. (.9)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 142

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
448258	2/22/2010	WIP	TIME Email to and from J. Guzzardo re: order on sur-reply on motion to dismiss appeal (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
448720	2/24/2010	WIP	TIME Conference with C. Cohan re: administrative issues related to multiple appeals (.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
448799	2/25/2010	WIP	TIME Examined District Court orders on motion to consolidate and stay (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
449353	2/25/2010	WIP	TIME Audit of filing of appearances in all appellate actions and coordination of filing of appearances in same.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	87.00
449227	2/26/2010	WIP	TIME Examined orders consolidating appeal (.1); examined reply to First Chicago motion for leave to appeal (.4); reviewed Trustee response (.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.90 0.00	380.00 T@13	342.00
467107	2/26/2010	WIP	TIME Discussion with A. Guon re: procedures for First Chicago appeal (.2)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	58.00
449778	3/1/2010	WIP	TIME Analysis of issues re: First Chicago appeal and possible sur-reply (1.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	532.00
449787	3/1/2010	WIP	TIME Discuss need and scope of sur-reply in First Chicago appeal, with A. Guon and J. Guzzardo	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 143

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
451292	TIME			IB	1.70	475.00	807.50
	3/8/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Revise drafts of motion for leave to file sur-reply to First Chicago motion (1.3); discuss revisions with A. Guon (.2) and J. Guzzardo (.2)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
451172	TIME			AJG	1.20	380.00	456.00
	3/8/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Reviewed and revised motion and sur-reply (.9); conference with J. Guzzardo re: same (.3).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
451322	TIME			TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
	3/8/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conferred with I. Bodenstein and J. Guzzardo re First Chicago appeal issues.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
451393	TIME			IB	0.40	475.00	190.00
	3/9/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Review and approve final version of motion for leave to file sur-reply	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
451426	TIME			AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
	3/9/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Final revisions to sur-reply (.2); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
451621	TIME			AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
	3/11/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conference with J. Brand re: status of appeal and pending adversaries (.2).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
452156	TIME			AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	3/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Examined order granting motion for leave to file sur-reply (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
454112	TIME			IB	0.40	475.00	190.00
	3/31/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Review District Court Memo and Order Dismissing both First Chicago and Askounis Appeals	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP			
454134	TIME			AJG	0.40	380.00	152.00
	4/1/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 144

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Examined memorandum order dismissing appeal (.3); email to B. Purcell re: same (.1).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
454797	TIME		4/1/2010 WIP Reviewed opinion granting motion to dismiss First Chicago appeal for lack of jurisdiction.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
457967	TIME		4/30/2010 WIP Review district court (.2) and 7th Circuit (.3) Notices of Appeal filed.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
458638	TIME		5/3/2010 WIP Conference with J. Brand re: appeal issues (.2); examined pleadings related to appeals to the district court and Seventh Circuit (.8); analyzed strategy for appeals (.8); examined case law and bankruptcy rules re: jurisdictional issues (3.8); conference with J. Guzzardo re: district court appeal (.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	6.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	2280.00
459023	TIME		5/3/2010 WIP Considered appellate jurisdiction issues pertaining to First Chicago appeal to 7th Circuit.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
458792	TIME		5/3/2010 WIP Discussion with A. Guon regarding strategies and go forwards with respect to First Chicago 7th Circuit appeal and pending district court appeal and follow up review of pleadings.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	377.00
458828	TIME		5/4/2010 WIP Examined Appellate rules re: deadlines for appeal and docketing issues (.8); conferences with clerk's office re: consolidates appeals (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	380.00
459032	TIME		5/4/2010 WIP Considered appellate jurisdiction issues pertaining to First Chicago appeal to 7th Circuit.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 145

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
459806	TIME	JWG	3.20	290.00	928.00
5/6/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Legal research and review of docket in connection with First Chicago appeals of procedures order and motion to dismiss. (3.2)		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
459988	TIME	AJG	0.70	380.00	266.00
5/10/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with J. Guzzardo re: motion to amend record on 7th Circuit appeal (.2); prepared 7th Circuit disclosure statement (.2); revised motion to supplement record on appeal (.3).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
460121	TIME	JWG	5.50	290.00	1595.00
5/10/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Legal research and drafting of FRAP 10(e) motion to supplement record on appeal and filing of same. (5.3) Discussion with D. Goodman and I. Bodenstein re: go forwards for motion to dismiss appeal. (.2)		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
460175	TIME	AJG	4.50	380.00	1710.00
5/12/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Research additional issues re: bankruptcy appellate jurisdiction (1.2); prepared motion to dismiss (3.3).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
460351	TIME	AJG	5.50	380.00	2090.00
5/13/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Additional research re: cases cited by First Chicago (2.6); prepared motion to dismiss appeal (2.9)		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
467207	TIME	AJG	0.70	380.00	266.00
5/14/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined order from 7th Circuit requiring jurisdictional brief (.1); conference with W. Dorsey re: same (.1); conference with D. Leibowitz re: update on appeal and other First Chicago issues (.2); examined appellate rules re: same (.3).		JURISDICTIONAL APP			
462673	TIME	DBG	1.50	475.00	712.50
5/14/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Revision of motion for preliminary injunction (1.2) review and revision of subpoena to BDO (.3)		JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 146

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
460442	5/14/2010	TIME	WIP Examined First Chicago's response to LG's motion to dismiss (.3); examined statement of issues on appeal and designation on appeal (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
461042	5/14/2010	TIME	WIP Review of designation on appeal in connection with procedures order appeal and compiling appellee's designation. (2.1)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	2.10 0.00	290.00 T@13	609.00
460563	5/14/2010	TIME	WIP Considered appellate jurisdictional issues and reviewed 7th Circuit order requiring jurisdictional memorandum.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
460519	5/16/2010	TIME	WIP Examined transcripts, pleading and related courts documents for First Chicago second jurisdictional appeal (2.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	2.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	798.00
462499	5/17/2010	TIME	WIP Legal research and drafting of motion to dismiss appeal of procedures order.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.00 0.00	290.00 T@13	290.00
467211	5/17/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with J. Guzzardo re: issues for district court appeal and reassignment (.3); examined local rules and operating procedures re: same (.3); examined order granting motion to supplement record on appeal (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	266.00
462503	5/18/2010	TIME	WIP Legal research and drafting of motion to dismiss appeal of procedures order.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	4.90 0.00	290.00 T@13	1421.00
462518	5/19/2010	TIME	WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	1.90 0.00	290.00 T@13	551.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 147

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Motion to dismiss procedures order appeal legal research and drafting of complaint.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
462520	TIME			JWG	2.60	290.00	754.00
	5/20/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Legal research and drafting of motion to dismiss procedures order.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
462542	TIME			JWG	2.50	290.00	725.00
	5/21/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Legal research and drafting of motion to dismiss procedural orders appeal.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
462546	TIME			JWG	2.20	290.00	638.00
	5/22/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Drafting of motion to dismiss procedures order appeal.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
462565	TIME			JWG	4.30	290.00	1247.00
	5/24/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Drafting of motion to dismiss appeal of procedures order.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
461402	TIME			AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
	5/24/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Conference with J. Guzzardo re: motion to dismiss new First Chicago appeal (.4); reviewed Seventh Circuit docket for update on status (.1).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
462799	TIME			TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
	5/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Reviewed First Chicago jurisdictional statement.	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
461556	TIME			AJG	1.30	380.00	494.00
	5/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Email to W. Dorsey re: Seventh Circuit appeal (.1); reviewed First Chicago's jurisdictional memorandum (1.2).	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
461800	TIME			IB	0.50	475.00	237.50
	5/25/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review First Chicago 7th circuit jurisdictional statement	JURISDICTIONAL APP			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 148

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
462567	TIME		5/25/2010 WIP Edits to Motion to Dismiss procedures order appeal. (2.1) Review of docket for timing of Motion to Dismiss and preliminary injunction hearing. (.3)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	2.40 0.00	290.00 T@13	696.00
462037	TIME		5/26/2010 WIP Analysis of issues re: filing response to jurisdictional memorandum (.4); prepared motion for leave to file response to jurisdictional memorandum (2.1); conference with I. Bodenstein re: same (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	2.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	1026.00
462581	TIME		5/26/2010 WIP Drafting and edits to motion to dismiss appeal of procedures order.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	4.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	1218.00
462123	TIME		5/26/2010 WIP Review J. Guzzardo draft of motion to dismiss FCB JURISDICTIONAL APP district court appeal.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
462122	TIME		5/26/2010 WIP Revise A. Guon draft of 7th circuit motion for leave to file response to FCB jurisdictional statement (.4); and discuss nature of response with A. Guon (.3).	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.70 0.00	475.00 T@13	332.50
462803	TIME		5/26/2010 WIP Conferred with I. Bodenstein and A. Guon re strategies in response to First Chicago jurisdictional memorandum (.6); reviewed and edited motion for leave to file response to First Chicago jurisdictional memorandum (.3).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.90 0.00	380.00 T@13	342.00
462587	TIME		5/27/2010 WIP Discussion with I. Bodenstein re: motion to dismiss procedures order. (.7) Edits to same and legal research in connection with same. (.5)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	348.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 149

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
462382	5/27/2010	TIME	WIP Further revise draft of Motion to Dismiss Appeal (.5) and give comments to J. Guzzardo (.2)	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.70 0.00	475.00 T@13	332.50
462272	5/27/2010	TIME	WIP Examined 7th Circuit Order re: Jurisdictional Memorandum (.1); conference with J. Guzzardo re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
462809	5/27/2010	TIME	WIP Reviewed 7th Circuit order inviting trustee to file brief re jurisdiction issues and conferred with A. Guon re same.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
462543	5/28/2010	TIME 1:57 PM	WIP Worked on response to Seventh Circuit and Jurisdictional memorandum	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	570.00
462595	5/28/2010	TIME	WIP Discussed 7th Circuit appeal with A. Guon. (.2) Pulled documents in connection with same. (.2) Reviewed First Chicago Jurisdictional Statement. (.5)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.90 0.00	290.00 T@13	261.00
462814	6/1/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with T. Banich re: update on discovery and appeal issues (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
464348	6/1/2010	TIME	WIP Compiling of supplemental record on appeal and edits to motion to dismiss appeal. (1.3); Review of motion to disqualify and edits to motion to dismiss. (2.3)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	3.60 0.00	290.00 T@13	1044.00
463955	6/2/2010	TIME	WIP Conferred with A. Guon re response to	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 150

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
		jurisdictional statement.			
464354	TIME 6/2/2010 WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP Coordination of filing of designation on appeal and motion to disqualify and serving of subpoenas on Trebels and Langs. (2.2) Edits to motion to dismiss procedures appeal. (2.6)	4.80 0.00	290.00 T@13	1392.00
463378	TIME 6/2/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP Finalized response to jurisdictional memorandum.	2.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	1064.00
464172	TIME 6/3/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP Reviewed and edited response to First Chicago jurisdictional memorandum (5.3); exchanged correspondence with A. Guon re discovery of First Chicago/Lewis & Gellen documents (.2).	5.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	2090.00
463985	TIME 6/3/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP Review 7th cir. jurisdictional statement (.5) and discuss with A. Guon (.2).	0.70 0.00	475.00 T@13	332.50
463856	TIME 6/3/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP Reviewed and revised response to jurisdictional memorandum (2.2); conference with D. Leibowtiz re: same (.1); reviewed and revised motion to dismiss district court appeal (2.6).	5.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	1900.00
463983	TIME 6/4/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP Review and revise latest draft of Motion to Dismiss Dist Ct appeal	0.90 0.00	475.00 T@13	427.50
464033	TIME 6/4/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP Revised motion to dismiss district court appeal (1.1)	1.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	418.00
464367	TIME 6/4/2010 WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	6.90 0.00	290.00 T@13	2001.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 151

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Legal research for Motion to Dismiss procedures order appeal and edits to same. (4.3) Drafting of motion to reassign appellate case. (2.6)	JURISDICTIONAL APP			
464049	TIME		6/4/2010 WIP Review and revise A. Guon draft of Motion to dismiss district court appeal.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.70 0.00	475.00 T@13	332.50
465082	TIME		6/7/2010 WIP Legal research and drafting of motion to dismiss procedures appeal. (.7)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.70 0.00	290.00 T@13	203.00
464480	TIME		6/8/2010 WIP Conference with J. Sieger re: Seventh Circuit appeal (.2); email to J. Sieger re: same (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
465109	TIME		6/8/2010 WIP Drafting of motion to dismiss appeal of procedures order and motion to reassign appeal. (3.1)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	3.10 0.00	290.00 T@13	899.00
464665	TIME		6/9/2010 WIP Conference with D. Leibowitz re: First Chicago appeals (.2); reviewed and revised motion to reassign cases (2.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	2.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	874.00
465114	TIME		6/9/2010 WIP Legal research and drafting of motion to dismiss appeal and motion to reassign appeal. (1.7)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.70 0.00	290.00 T@13	493.00
464736	TIME		6/10/2010 WIP Revised and finalized motion to dismiss First Chicago district court appeal	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	1.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	380.00
465120	TIME		6/10/2010 WIP Drafting, legal research and final edits for motion to dismiss procedures order appeal and drafting of	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR JURISDICTIONAL APP	6.80 0.00	290.00 T@13	1972.00

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 152

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
	motion to reassign appeal, including notices of filing.				
464807	TIME	IB	0.50	475.00	237.50
6/10/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review final versions of Motion to dismiss Dist. Ct Appeal(.3) and Motion to Reassign Dist Ct. Appeal(.2)				
465066	TIME	AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
6/15/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined order denying motion to reassign case. JURISDICTIONAL APP				
466264	TIME	JWG	0.20	290.00	58.00
6/15/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review of docket and follow up on timing of Motion to Dismiss procedures appeal. (.2)				
466290	TIME	JWG	0.50	290.00	145.00
6/22/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review of First Chicago brief on appeal of procedures order.				
465930	TIME	AJG	2.30	380.00	874.00
6/24/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Prepared for (.3); court appearance re: motion to dismiss First Chicago appeal including conference with W. Dorsey after appeal (2.0)				
465994	TIME	AJG	0.90	380.00	342.00
6/25/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined additional case law re: appellate jurisdiction and finality (.9);				
Total: JURISDICTIONAL APPEALS					
		Billable	258.10		84089.00
		Unbillable	0.70		238.00
		Total	258.80		84327.00
<u>Nickname 1: LAKELAND BANK</u>					
433667	TIME	IB	0.60	465.00	279.00
11/4/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review adversary complaint filed by Lakeland BankLAKELAND BANK				

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 153

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
467259	11/9/2009	TIME	WIP Examined correspondence from Lakeland Bank re: LAKELAND BANK response to demand letter (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.20 0.00	365.00 T@14	73.00
468513	12/31/2009	TIME	WIP E-mail to and from D. Leibowitz re: Lakeland complaint (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	36.50
456436	4/15/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with J. Brand re: Lakeland servicing issues (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
457031	4/21/2010	TIME	WIP Court appearance on hearing re: Lakeland Bank segregation order	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
468575	5/24/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with J. Brand re: Lakeland litigation issues (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
467852	6/16/2010	TIME	WIP Discuss Lakeland Bank adversary proceeding with A. Guon.	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	58.00
467962	6/22/2010	TIME	WIP Review background documents and pleadings (3.2); email correspondence with J. Brand regarding same (.1).	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	3.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	957.00
467960	6/22/2010	TIME	WIP Discuss case status and background with J. Brand	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.70 0.00	290.00 T@13	203.00
465805	6/23/2010	TIME	WIP Legal research relating to leave to file amended	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	2.10 0.00	290.00 T@13	609.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 154

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			pleading.				
465806	6/23/2010	TIME	WIP Email to J. Brand summarizing Seventh Circuit research re: discovery issues.	CED A106 Communicate (w/ LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	0.50 0.00	290.00 T@13	145.00
467969	6/24/2010	TIME	WIP Revise reply brief in support of motion to amend counterclaim in Lakeland adversary proceeding; discuss same with J. Brand.	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	4.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	1247.00
467979	6/29/2010	TIME	WIP Discuss status of Lakeland's discovery responses with J. Brand; related email correspondence.	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	1.40 0.00	290.00 T@13	406.00
467980	6/29/2010	TIME	WIP Discuss case status and Trustee's motion to amend counterclaim in Lakeland adversary proceeding with A. Guon.	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	0.60 0.00	290.00 T@13	174.00
467984	6/29/2010	TIME	WIP Review background documents, pleadings, etc.	CED MCLE LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	1.40 0.00	290.00 T@13	406.00
467987	6/30/2010	TIME	WIP Prepare for and attend hearing on Trustee's motion to amend counterclaim; discuss same with A. Guon and J. Brand.	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	2.70 0.00	290.00 T@13	783.00
467989	6/30/2010	TIME	WIP Email correspondence relating to Lakeland's outstanding discovery responses with J. Cerra (counsel for Lakeland) and J. Brand.	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	0.70 0.00	290.00 T@13	203.00
467992	6/30/2010	TIME	WIP Prepare appearance on behalf of Trustee in Lakeland adversary proceeding, arrange for filing;	CED Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LAKELAND BANK	0.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	87.00

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 155

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			discuss same with J. Brand.				
Total: LAKELAND BANK				Billable	20.00		6056.00
				Unbillable	0.00		0.00
				Total	20.00		6056.00
<u>Nickname 1: LEASING ISSUES</u>							
432568	TIME			AJG	0.10	365.00	36.50
	11/1/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		E-mail to R. Elli re: draft stipulation (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
436656	TIME			KMH	2.20	275.00	605.00
	11/2/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Telephone conference with S. Herndon regarding schedule of leases (.2); conference with A. Guon regarding strategy related to loans (.2); telephone conference with C. Barr, attorney for First Merit Bank regarding leases (.2); telephone conference with S. Herndon regarding Union Hospital Payments (.2); review file documents and correspondence related to leases (1.4).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
432756	TIME			AJG	0.40	365.00	146.00
	11/2/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Conference with K. Hyde re: preparing complaint for stay violations (.3); examined correspondence from J. Carroll re: First Bank response to demand letter (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
433566	TIME			KMH	2.00	275.00	550.00
	11/4/2009			Legal Services	1.00	T@14	
	WIP		Review and analyze file correspondence including 10/23/09 notice to secured parties and responses received today (.5). Create chart to track responses from secured parties (.5).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
437919	TIME			KMH	0.80	275.00	220.00
	11/4/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Review and analyze additional correspondence related to secured parties and responses received.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
448436	TIME			AJG	0.30	365.00	109.50
	11/5/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Conference with S. Herndon re: Sign Producers	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 156

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
		UCC (.2); conference with E. Mashburn re: Sign Producers lease (.1).			
434241	TIME 11/6/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	36.50
		E-mail to and from S. Herndon re First Bank response to demand letter (.1)			
434583	TIME 11/11/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	36.50
		Conference with I. Martinez re: requesting time to respond to demand letter (.1)			
434991	TIME 11/16/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	365.00 T@14	73.00
		Conference with M. Solow re: V V Ventures lease issues (.2)			
435310	TIME 11/18/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.80 0.00	365.00 T@14	292.00
		Examined documents from M. Small re: VV Ventures lease issues (.4); Examined settlement proposal from CompuVision (.3); e-mail to S. Herndon re: same (.1).			
435384	TIME 11/18/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	36.50
		Conference with M. Iqual re: UCC financing statements			
435920	TIME 11/19/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.90 0.00	365.00 T@14	328.50
		Conference with B. Purcell and R. Ellia re: responses to demand letter, motion to dismiss and other leasing issues.			
435659	TIME 11/20/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	36.50
		Correspondence to D. Leibowitz re: receipt of Van Den Huvell payments.			
435739	TIME 11/20/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.40 0.00	365.00 T@14	146.00
		Examined correspondence from Signature Bank re:			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 157

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
	collections (.1); examined correspondence from M. Fenton re: Bank Financial (.2); conference with M. Fenton re: same (.1).				
436045	TIME 11/23/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.30 0.00	365.00 T@14	109.50
	Examined correspondence from E. Stern re: Commerce Bank's response to demand letter (.2); email from P. Barr and to B. Purcell re: Bradley Animal lease (.1).	LEASING ISSUES			
436203	TIME 11/24/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	1.20 0.00	365.00 T@14	438.00
	Examined e-mails from S. Csar re: incomplete leases and servicer issues (.2); conference with B. Purcell re: lease funding issues (.3); examined leases from Park National Bank (.7);	LEASING ISSUES			
436478	TIME 11/25/2009 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.20 0.00	465.00 T@14	93.00
	Emails with R. Cecola re: lease buyout.	LEASING ISSUES			
438797	TIME 11/30/2009 WIP	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	1.20 0.00	235.00 T@14	282.00
	Research creditor perfection via possession of debtor	LEASING ISSUES			
437072	TIME 11/30/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.20 0.00	365.00 T@14	73.00
	Examined correspondence from First Clover Leaf Bank re: RBX leases and e-mail to B. Purcell re: same (.2).	LEASING ISSUES			
438813	TIME 12/9/2009 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.30 0.30	465.00 T@14 Do Not Bill	139.50
	Phone call with J. Gallo re: TCG buyout (.2); discuss with D. Leibowitz (.1).	LEASING ISSUES			
438853	TIME 12/10/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.40 0.00	365.00 T@14	146.00
	Examined issues re: filing of 506 adversary against all lenders (.4).	LEASING ISSUES			

7/30/2010
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
 Slip Listing

Page 158

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
439047	TIME 12/11/2009	IB Legal Services	0.70 0.70	465.00 T@14	325.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR		Do Not Bill	
	Review TCG buyout figure(.2);discuss with S. Csar LEASING ISSUES (.3) and J. Gallo(.2)				
439181	TIME 12/14/2009	IB Legal Services	0.10 0.10	465.00 T@14	46.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR		Do Not Bill	
	Phone call from Mark Fenton re: TCG Packaging LEASING ISSUES				
439368	TIME 12/15/2009	IB Legal Services	0.50 0.50	465.00 T@14	232.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR		Do Not Bill	
	Brief Jim Coston re: TCG Packaging buyout issues LEASING ISSUES re: handing over matter				
439314	TIME 12/15/2009	AJG Legal Services	0.20 0.00	365.00 T@14	73.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined e-mail from E. Haynie re: Orego facility LEASING ISSUES lease and e-mail to J. Brand re: same (.1); conference with D. Cardonics re: lease stream payments (.1).				
469855	TIME 12/22/2009	AJG Legal Services	0.50 0.00	365.00 T@14	182.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined information re: Videll Holding lease (.1); LEASING ISSUES e-mail to R. Elli re: same (.1); conference with M. Schwartz re: automatic stay violation issues (.3).				
440239	TIME 12/23/2009	AJG Legal Services	0.50 0.00	365.00 T@14	182.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with R. Elli re leases with partial LEASING ISSUES payment vendor issues (.4); email to and from R. Elli re: same (.1).				
441311	TIME 12/23/2009	MLS Legal Services	0.80 0.00	235.00 T@14	188.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review letter from Videll Holding Corp re stay LEASING ISSUES violation and review file re same (.2) and request lease (.1); revise and distribute motion to modify shaw Gussis retention order (.5)				
440441	TIME 12/28/2009	JWG Legal Services	0.20 0.00	270.00 T@14	54.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Call with M. Rivers (Lessee) re: payoff of lease and LEASING ISSUES claim and direction of lessee to Trustee's office.				

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 159

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
(.2)					
440411	TIME 12/28/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.00 0.00	365.00 T@14	365.00
	Examined Videl lease and purchase order (.3); examined Web Creations lease (.2); conference with S. Herndon re: partial funding of leases (.3); conference with M. Schwartz re: title transfer issues (.2).				
441321	TIME 12/29/2009 WIP	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.20 0.00	235.00 T@14	282.00
	Draft form letter of stay violation notice				
440581	TIME 12/29/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.40 0.00	365.00 T@14	146.00
	Examined UCC provisions re: transfer of title to lease equipment and vendor issues(.3); e-mail to B. Purcell re: same (.1).				
441276	TIME 12/30/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	5.70 0.00	365.00 T@14	2080.50
	Meeting at IFC office with B. Purcell, R. Elli, S. Herndon, S. Csar re: leasing issues related to CoActiv, M&T, operational issues and financing (5.3); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.4).				
441429	TIME 12/31/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.90 0.00	365.00 T@14	328.50
	Conference with B. Purcell re: update on CoActiv, court square and other lenders (.4); reviewed CoActiv analysis from R. Elli (.5)				
468515	TIME 12/31/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	365.00 T@14	73.00
	E-mails to T. Banich re: CoActiv and M&T (.2)				
445176	TIME 1/4/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
	Emails to and from S. Herndon re: leasing issues (.2).				
445203	TIME 1/5/2010 WIP	KMH Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.90 0.00	275.00 T@14	247.50

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC

Slip Listing

Page 160

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Telephone conference w. C. Barr regarding matured lease stream for First Merit Bank for Uniton Hospital (.3); correspondence with C. Barr regarding same (.1); correspondence with A. Guon regarding same (.1); correspondence from S. Herndon regarding same (.1); conference with A. Guon regarding lease stream (.2); additional correspondence regarding lease stream (.1)	LEASING ISSUES			
443307	TIME			MLS	1.20	245.00	294.00
	1/5/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Continued drafting form stay violation notice.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
445180	TIME			AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
	1/5/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Email to R. Elli re: revisions to stay violation letter (.1); email to B. Barrett and to S. Herndon re: First Merit lease (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
445187	TIME			AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
	1/6/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conference with B. Purcell re: yesterday's hearing and leasing litigation (.5).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
443316	TIME			MLS	0.80	245.00	196.00
	1/7/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Meet with A. Guon re stay violation notice (.2) and revise same (.6)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
443055	TIME			IB	0.10	475.00	47.50
	1/8/2010			Legal Services	0.10	T@13	
	WIP		Phone call with R. Ciambrone re: TGB Packaging lease	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR		Do Not Bill	
				LEASING ISSUES			
442479	TIME			AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
	1/13/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conference with M. Small re: VV Ventures lease (.2); email to D. Leibowitz re: Illinois Central Trucking lease (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			
442688	TIME			AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
	1/14/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		E-mail to and from J. Brand re: vendor interference issues (.1); multiple e-mail to D. Leibowitz and L. Natchinson re: same (.2)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
				LEASING ISSUES			

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 161

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
442967	TIME		1/15/2010 WIP Conference with G. Ostfeld re: authority to communicate with T. Laurie (.1); conference with T. Laurie re: First Portland Corp books (.6); conference with B. Purcell re: same (.5); review J&S Commercial lease (.3); e-mail to S. Csar re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	608.00
444504	TIME		1/21/2010 WIP Review Dexter/J&S letter and lease and draft cease and desist letter re same.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.80 0.00	245.00 T@13	196.00
445361	TIME		1/26/2010 WIP Meeting with A. Guon re Dexter & Cheney stay violation letter (.2); revise letter accordingly (.4); distribute same (.2); call with Oleska, Pinnacle, receive settlement offer (.2) talk to A. Guon re same (.1)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.10 0.00	245.00 T@13	269.50
444302	TIME		1/26/2010 WIP Conference with M. Schwartz re: Pinnacle and Dexter stay violations (.2); revised Dexter stay violation letter (.1); examined multiple emails from D. Leibowitz, R. Elli and S. Csar re: leasing issues (.5); examined SourceOne complaint (.4); e-mail to and from B. Barrett re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	456.00
445341	TIME		1/27/2010 WIP Meeting with A. Guon re new stay violation notices (.2) review Sciton file and draft stay violation notice re same (2); meet with A. Guon re Sciton stay violation notice (.3)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	2.50 0.00	245.00 T@13	612.50
444584	TIME		1/27/2010 WIP Conference with W. Barrett re: SourceOne litigation (.2); conference with M. Schwartz re: same (.1); email to and from R. Elli re: Richo leases (.1); e-mails to and from R. Irwin re: Merry-X ray (.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	304.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 162

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
445374	TIME	MLS	0.60	245.00	147.00
1/29/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Call Oleska re Pinnacle settlement offer (.2); confer with A. Guon (.1) email Oleska denying settlement offer (.2); email Steve Csar re Web Creations account status (.1)					
445110	TIME	AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
1/29/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Emails to and from M. Schwartz and S. Csar re: Web creations default issues (.2); conference with S. Csar re: same (.1).					
447531	TIME	AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
2/1/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with D. Antignoli re: Clover Leaf bank leases (.2); email to S. Csar re: same (.1).					
447354	TIME	MLS	3.00	245.00	735.00
2/1/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review files on stay violations and draft chart of status on each stay violation (2.5); email and call Steve Csar re filling in gaps in the chart (.5)					
447537	TIME	AJG	0.60	380.00	228.00
2/1/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined email from R. Elli re: Springdal vendor issues (.1); conference with R. Elli and S. Csar re: leasing collection issues (.3); email from S. Csar re: Pinnacle interference (.1); examined e-mail from R. Elli re: peoplenet leases (.1).					
447541	TIME	AJG	2.70	380.00	1026.00
2/2/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with S. Herndon, B. Purcell, S. Csar and outstanding lease collection issues (.9); reviewed Wed Design leases (.2); conference with L. Oleska re: Pinnacle/Web Design (.2); conference with S. Csar re: same (.2); conferences (2) with B. Purcell re: lease litigation (.5); conference with J. Carrol re: First Bank and Trust leases (.1); conference with D. Leibowitz re: lease collection procedures (.6)					

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 163

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
447356	TIME		2/2/2010 WIP Review files and draft stay violation notices for Diamondback Services (1); Medical Management (1); Pinnacle (1). Update status chart (.5).	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	3.50 0.00	245.00 T@13	857.50
447561	TIME		2/4/2010 WIP Conference with B. Purcell re: lease settlement issues (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
446912	TIME		2/5/2010 WIP Conference with A. Guon regarding rights to residuals in leases.	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	58.00
447569	TIME		2/5/2010 WIP Conference with B. Chatz re: Arnstein documents (1); email to S. Csar re: Merry X Ray leases (.1); examine email from S. Csar re: Web Designs settlement (.1); email to B. Chatz re: document inspection (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
446848	TIME		2/8/2010 WIP Conference with P. Barr re: Sourceone St. Louis litigation (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
447172	TIME		2/10/2010 WIP Conference with M. Schwartz re: Sourceone suggestion of bankruptcy (.2); revised same (.1); examined Pinnacle indemnification agreement (.1); conference with L. Oleska re: same (.1); conference with M. Abramson re: document issues (.1); email to R. Elli re: same (.2); reviewed Arnstein re: invoices (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	380.00
447471	TIME		2/10/2010 WIP Draft suggestion of bankruptcy for Orthopedics litigation (.6); research filing procedures for district ct. of St. Louis (.2)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.80 0.00	245.00 T@13	196.00

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC
Slip Listing

Page 164

Slip ID	Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status	Client		Bill Status	
Description	Matter			
447331	KAB	1.80	290.00	522.00
2/10/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review leasing documents, settlement agreement, LEASING ISSUES UCC financing statements and related loan documents regarding interest in residuals				
447399	AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
2/11/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with R. Elli re: court square residual LEASING ISSUES issues (.2)				
447397	AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
2/12/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined email from D. Leibowitz re: R&L Leasing LEASING ISSUES (.1)				
447490	AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
2/12/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with D. Antignoli re: Clover Leaf Bank LEASING ISSUES (.2); email to S. Csar re: same (.1).				
447693	KAB	0.30	290.00	87.00
2/15/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review and analyze residual lease issue and LEASING ISSUES confer with A. Guon regarding same (.3)				
450561	MLS	1.50	245.00	367.50
2/16/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Update chart of vendor stay violators (.4); review file LEASING ISSUES and draft and distribute Springdale ice letter (1.1)				
447786	AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
2/16/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined email from C. Chandro re: Richo leases LEASING ISSUES (.2)				
450575	MLS	3.80	245.00	931.00
2/17/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review big hairy dog file and draft stay violation LEASING ISSUES notice (1); Review Jensen Bros. file and draft stay violation notice (.8); Review w ventures file and draft stay violation notice (.9); Review little Caesars file and draft stay violation notice (1.1)				

7/30/2010
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC

Slip Listing

Page 165

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
450586	TIME 2/18/2010 WIP Update status chart (.4); review and distribute drafted stay violation notices to vendors, lessees and IFC group (.6)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.00 0.00	245.00 T@13	245.00
448049	TIME 2/18/2010 WIP Examined email from D. Leibowitz re: Eleven wireless (.2); examined Visual Graffiti lease documentation (.3); email to S. Csar re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00
449194	TIME 2/25/2010 WIP Conference with A. Guon regarding DB Swim's security interest and related issues (.7)	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.70 0.00	290.00 T@13	203.00
448935	TIME 2/25/2010 WIP Conference with L. Oleska re: Pinnacle equipment (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
449056	TIME 2/26/2010 WIP Examined WSB motion to transfer venue of SourceOne litigation and related documents (.3); email to D. Leibowitz re: same (.2); conference with B. Barrett re: supporting WSB motion to transfer SourceOne litigation (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00
449996	TIME 3/1/2010 WIP Conduct Westlaw research on perfected financing statements and financing statements filed in name of different party and review and analyze cases regarding same (2.0)	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	2.00 0.00	290.00 T@13	580.00
449940	TIME 3/2/2010 WIP Emails to and from C. Barr re: First Merit lease (.3); conference with P. Barr re: same (.2); email to B. Purcell re: same (.1); examined correspondence from T. Jeffrey re: Signature Bank collections (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	266.00