

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 166

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
450848	TIME	AJG	0.40	380.00	152.00
3/4/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conferences (2) with K. Bacher re: lien research (.4)		LEASING ISSUES			
450969	TIME	KAB	3.80	290.00	1102.00
3/5/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Confer with R. Glantz regarding assignment of UCC (.1); Conduct additional Westlaw research on curing defective UCC through assignment and read and review cases regarding same (3.7)		LEASING ISSUES			
455487	TIME	RWG	0.50	475.00	237.50
3/5/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Research UCC filing error issues/perfection and assignment issues		LEASING ISSUES			
450984	TIME	AJG	1.20	380.00	456.00
3/5/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with K. Bacher re: lien issues (.2); conference with R. Elli, S. Csar and M. Schwartz re: lease collection efforts (.3); conference with M. Schwartz re: Big Harry Dog vendor issues (.2); email to D. Leibowitz re: lease collections (.1); conference with J. Brand re: strategy for lease collections (.4).		LEASING ISSUES			
451166	TIME	AJG	0.80	380.00	304.00
3/8/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined Nassau and MDM collection agreements (.5); conference with J. Brand re: same (.3); email to B. Purcell re: same (.1).		LEASING ISSUES			
451200	TIME	AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
3/8/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with B. Purcell re: lease perfection issues (.3); conference with K. Bacher re: perfection issues (.2)		LEASING ISSUES			
451384	TIME	AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
3/9/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Email from C. Barr re: First Merit leases (.1); emails to and from P. Purcell re: same (.1).		LEASING ISSUES			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 167

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
	Posting Status	Client Matter		Bill Status	
	Description				
451463	TIME	AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
	3/10/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with L. Oleska re: Pinnacle Lease.				
451457	TIME	AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	3/10/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Email to and from J. Alwin re: Source One (.1).				
453443	TIME	MLS	5.00	245.00	1225.00
	3/11/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review files for Eleven Wireless, Technogym and Eddy Restaurant and send stay violation notices re same (3.8); talk with R. Elli re secure tec situation with back up tapes and send stay violation letter to securetec (1.2)				
451773	TIME	KAB	5.20	290.00	1508.00
	3/11/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review and analyze applicable cases and treatises regarding curing defective UCC (1.0); Prepare draft memorandum addressing defective financing statement and whether defective financing statement can be cured through assignment (4.2)				
451679	TIME	AJG	0.90	380.00	342.00
	3/12/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Reviewed and revised memo re: financing statement (.6); conference with K. Bacher re: same (.3)				
451763	TIME	KAB	0.50	290.00	145.00
	3/12/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Prepare revisions to Memo regarding assignment of defective lease (.3); conference with A. Guon regarding same (.2)				
451946	TIME	AJG	0.80	380.00	304.00
	3/15/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Email to and from J. Alwin re: SourceOne litigation (.1); prepared correspondence to J. Alwin re: Trustee's support for motion (.3); reviewed and revised memo re: UCC filings (.4).				

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 168

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
452003	3/15/2010	TIME	WIP Prepared additional revisions to memorandum regarding assignment of defective financing statement (1.1); Review applicable cases and follow-up research regarding same (.4); Confer with A. Guon regarding revisions (.2)	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.70 0.00	290.00 T@13	493.00
452064	3/16/2010	TIME	WIP Email to B. Purcell re: US Bank lease (.1); examined email from R. Elli re: Mia resorts (.1); conference with R. Elli re: same (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
468572	3/17/2010	TIME	WIP Examined order from Missouri Bankruptcy Court transferring SourceOne litigation (.1); conference with J. Brand re: same (.2); examined correspondence from M. Schwartz re: Eleven wireless and other entities violating the stay (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
453458	3/17/2010	TIME	WIP Review and distribute stay violation notices	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.50 0.00	245.00 T@13	122.50
453464	3/18/2010	TIME	WIP Update chart of stay violators and review respective files - email S. Czar re updating chart (2) meeting with/Allen re various stay violators (.5)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	2.50 0.00	245.00 T@13	612.50
452267	3/18/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with M. Schwartz re: update all pending vendor lease disputes (.5).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
452262	3/18/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with M. Schwartz re: leasing information (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
452360	3/19/2010	TIME	WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 169

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Conference with J. Ganz re: RBS leases (.2); email from J. Ganz and to D. Liebowitz re: same (.1)	LEASING ISSUES			
452657	TIME		3/22/2010 WIP Conference with B. Purcell re: RBS leases (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
454136	TIME		3/22/2010 WIP Update chart from meeting with A. Guon and email S. Czar for particulars on many of the stay violators.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	3.00 0.00	245.00 T@13	735.00
452818	TIME		3/23/2010 WIP 9:49 AM Email from B. Purcell re: settlement offer from Pinnacle.	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
454835	TIME		3/25/2010 WIP Return calls and send information to people receiving stay violation notices.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	4.30 0.00	245.00 T@13	1053.50
453390	TIME		3/26/2010 WIP Review Trustee's motion for omnibus procedure to resolve lease claims	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
453377	TIME		3/26/2010 WIP Email to J. Brand re: leasing motion (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
453599	TIME		3/28/2010 WIP Review Trustees Omnibus Lease Settlement Authority Motion	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
454849	TIME		3/29/2010 WIP Return calls and send information to people receiving stay violation notices.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	4.60 0.00	245.00 T@13	1127.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 170

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
454853	3/30/2010	TIME	WIP Return calls and send information to people receiving stay violation notices.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.90 0.00	245.00 T@13	465.50
454856	3/31/2010	TIME	WIP Return calls and send information to people receiving stay violation notices.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	3.90 0.00	245.00 T@13	955.50
454040	3/31/2010	TIME	WIP Research re: leasing renewals (.6); conference with K. Bacher re: same (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	304.00
454320	4/1/2010	TIME	WIP Examined mail from P. Bar re: Salinas Valley lease (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
461386	4/1/2010	TIME	WIP Return calls and send information to people receiving stay violation notices.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	4.50 0.00	245.00 T@13	1102.50
454488	4/1/2010	TIME	WIP Conduct Westlaw research regarding automatic renewal of leases and purchase option (2.2)	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	2.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	638.00
454539	4/2/2010	TIME	WIP Conferences (2) with J. Brand re: lease disposition and settlement issues (.8); conference with S. Csar re: Papp Mint Lease (.1); examined Pappa Mint documents (.3); email to D. Hilton re: same (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	570.00
455439	4/6/2010	TIME	WIP Additional research regarding purchase option and automatic renewal of leases and review cases regarding same	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.50 0.00	290.00 T@13	435.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 171

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
455259	TIME		4/6/2010 WIP Email to and from D. Leibowitz re: RBS payments (.1); conference with K. Bacher re: \$1 out leases (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
455686	TIME		4/8/2010 WIP Review emails and respond re: approach to take to DZ and WSB concerns with lease collection retention motion	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
455635	TIME		4/8/2010 WIP E-mail to and from D. Leibowitz re: lease collections motion (.1); examined email from B. Purcell re: RBS (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
456168	TIME		4/13/2010 WIP Examined Karlville complaint (.2); email to S. Csar and M. Schwartz re: suggestion of bankruptcy re: same (.1); email to B. Barrett re: Karlville lease complaint (.1); examined emails from objecting parties re: lease settlement procedures (.6).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	380.00
456241	TIME		4/13/2010 WIP Review Co-Activ, Northside, Lakeside, First Chicago and First Portland Objections to Omnibus Lease Settlement Procedures motion	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.80 0.00	475.00 T@13	380.00
456371	TIME		4/14/2010 WIP Examined email from S. Csar re: Karlville lease (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
460033	TIME		5/10/2010 WIP Reviewed proposed revisions to disposition order (.4); conference with J. Brand re: same (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	266.00
461151	TIME		5/21/2010 WIP Examined and analyzed case law re: competing	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	4.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	1558.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 172

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			interests in chattel paper and underlying equipment (3.8); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.3).				
461498	5/24/2010	TIME	WIP Examined case law re: lease payment streams (.8)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	304.00
462091	5/26/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with J. Tidland from Commerce Bank lease issues (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
464387	6/1/2010	TIME	WIP Update stay violation chart (.4); follow up with S. Czar regarding same (.5); draft various stay violation notices (.6); discuss Karlville stay issues with J. Brandt (.2);	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	1.70 0.00	245.00 T@13	416.50
463443	6/2/2010	TIME	WIP Email to S. Csar re: Web Creations settlement.	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
464203	6/7/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with D. Leibowitz re: update on various leasing matters (.3); email to L. Oleska re: Pinnacle/Web Creations lease dispute (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
464985	6/14/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with R. Smolev and J. Christian re: settlement discussions (.5); conference with J. Brand re: same (.2); conference with B. Purcell re: same (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.90 0.00	380.00 T@13	342.00
465050	6/15/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with R. Smolev, B. Purcel, S. Herndon and DZ representatives re: Wells Fargo lockbox (.3); email to J. Brand re: same (.1); conference with B. Purcell re: same (.3)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	266.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 173

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
465229	6/16/2010	TIME	WIP Examined emails from R. Smolev re: DZ reconciliation (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
465704	6/22/2010	TIME	WIP Email to and from L. Oleska re: settlement with Web Creations.	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
466224	6/28/2010	TIME	WIP Email to and from C. Chandro re: Rico USA lease (.1); email to J. Brand re: form of settlement agreement for leases (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
466442	6/29/2010	TIME	WIP Email to and from D. Leibowitz re: Norvergence litigation.	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LEASING ISSUES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
Total: LEASING ISSUES				Billable	131.80		40244.00
				Unbillable	2.70		1066.50
				Total	134.50		41310.50
<u>Nickname 1: LUDWIG &amp; LEVINSON</u>							
434466	11/2/2009	TIME	WIP Conferred with A. Guon re stipulation and November 4 Ludwig & Levinson Lift Stay Hearing.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.50 0.00	365.00 T@14	547.50
467223	11/2/2009	TIME	WIP Conference with R. Elli re: Ludwig motion (.2); conference with G. Ostfeld re: tomorrow's hearing (.2); conference with G. Ostfeld and T. Laurie (.6); reviewed and revised stipulation from G. Ostfeld for lift stay hearing (1.1); examined comments from R. Elli re: Ludwig stipulation (.2); e-mail to D. Leibowitz re: status of settlement negotiation (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.50 0.00	365.00 T@14	912.50
434472	11/3/2009	TIME	WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	8.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	2956.50



7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 174

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Prepared for and attended meetings with IFC personnel in preparation for evidentiary hearing on Ludwig motion to lift stay (5.4); traveled to and from Morton Grove (2.0); conference call with D. Leibowitz re settlement negotiations (.7).	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
467236	TIME			AJG	8.40	365.00	3066.00
	11/3/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Court appearance on lift stay (.8); prepared for meeting a IFC (1.2); meeting at IFC with T. Banich, S. Herndon, R. Elli and S. Csar and D. Keenan re: preparation for Ludwig lift stay hearing (6.0); conference with D. Leibowitz re: DZ portfolio and tomorrow's hearing (.4);	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
434474	TIME			TGB	10.20	365.00	3723.00
	11/4/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Prepared for (2.5) and attended evidentiary hearing on Ludwig motion to lift stay and conferred with clients and counsel re same (7.5); conferred with I. Bodenstein re results of hearing (.2).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
448432	TIME			AJG	1.00	365.00	365.00
	11/5/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Conference with M. Gensburg re: settlement of lift stay and 363 sale (.2); analysis of issues re: negotiation of DZ/Ludwig settlement (.8);	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
434476	TIME			TGB	0.20	365.00	73.00
	11/5/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Drafted and reviewed correspondence re November 4 Ludwig lift-stay hearing.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
434337	TIME			AJG	0.10	365.00	36.50
	11/9/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Conference with G. Ostfeld re: discovery documents for Ludwig lift stay (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
434912	TIME			TGB	1.10	365.00	401.50
	11/10/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP		Conferred with A. Guon re Ludwig lift-stay status and strategies (.3); reviewed DZ portfolio analysis and conferred with A. Guon re same (.3); conference call with S. Csar, R. Elli, B. Purcell and A. Guon re same and strategies (.5).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 175

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
434503	TIME 11/10/2009	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	766.50
	WIP Conference with T. Banich re: DZ analysis and Ludwig issues (.2); prepared for (.4) and participated in conference call with S. Csar, B. Purcell, R. Elli and T. Banich re: DZ portfolio and Ludwig lift stay (.3); examined subpoena for Ludwig lift stay (.2); reviewed documents from Ludwig re: DZ portfolio (.8); e-mail to D. Leibowitz re: Ludwig lift stay (.2).				
434929	TIME 11/11/2009	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	365.00 T@14	219.00
	WIP Analyzed Ludwig lift-stay issues (.2); reviewed correspondence re same (.1); conference call with M. Gensburg and A. Guon re November 12 hearing and resolution of motion to lift stay and further conference with A. Guon re same (.3).				
467260	TIME 11/11/2009	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	365.00 T@14	219.00
	WIP E-mails to and from J. Brand and D. Leibowitz re: Ludwig lift stay (.1); analysis of issues re: withdrawing objection to Ludwig lift stay (.3); conference with M. Gensburg and T. Banich re: resolution of Ludwig lift stay motion (.2)				
434937	TIME 11/12/2009	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.50 0.00	365.00 T@14	182.50
	WIP Conferred with A. Guon and I. Bodenstein re Ludwig lift-stay issues.				
434769	TIME 11/12/2009	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.90 0.00	365.00 T@14	328.50
	WIP Conference with M. Gensburg re: draft order (.1); court appearance re: Ludwig lift stay motion (.8).				
434943	TIME 11/13/2009	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.40 0.00	365.00 T@14	511.00
	WIP Reviewed draft order lifting stay prepared by Ludwig (.2); telephone conference with A. Guon re same (.2); reviewed Stock Pledge Agreements in connection with text of proposed order, and drafted and reviewed correspondence with A. Guon and J. Brand re same (1.0).				

7/30/2010  
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
 Slip Listing

Page 176

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
435994	11/13/2009	TIME	WIP Conference with B. Barrett re: Ludwig lift stay motion (.2); conference with M. Gensburg re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	365.00 T@14	109.50
434985	11/16/2009	TIME	WIP Examined stock pledge agreement (.4); conferences with M. Gensberg re: same (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.70 0.00	365.00 T@14	255.50
435928	11/16/2009	TIME	WIP Conferred with A. Guon re terms of lift-stay order, preference adversaries and motion to dismiss bankruptcy case.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	365.00 T@14	219.00
435610	11/19/2009	TIME	WIP Phone call from Jim Newbold re: First Portland question	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.10 0.00	465.00 T@14	46.50
468518	1/15/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with G. Ostfeld re: authority to communicate with T. Laury (.1); conference with T. Laury re: First Portland Corp books (.6); conference with B. Purcell re: same (.5)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	456.00
468520	2/2/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with D. Leibowitz re: Ludwig meeting (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
450744	3/4/2010	TIME	WIP Examined US Bank judgment against First Portland and investigated same (.6); email to A. Rhim re: same (.1); conference with R. Elli re: US Bank judgment (.3); conference with G. Ostfeld re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	418.00
450970	3/5/2010	TIME	WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 177

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Email to and from G. Ostfeld re: US Bank judgment against First Portland (.1).	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
451612	TIME		3/11/2010 WIP Conference with I. Bodenstein re: First Portland Corp issues (.3); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
452109	TIME		3/17/2010 WIP Conference with I. Bodenstein re: Ludwig issues (.3)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
453218	TIME		3/25/2010 WIP Emails to and from D. Leibowitz and B. Purcell re: Monday's meeting (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
454066	TIME		3/31/2010 WIP Examined First Portland's motion for 2004 examination (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
454795	TIME		3/31/2010 WIP Conferred with A. Guon re possible adversary proceeding against Ludwig.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
455120	TIME		3/31/2010 WIP Teleconference with Guon and Trustee re: First Portland Pioneer and Ludwig issue	DBG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	475.00 T@13	285.00
468574	TIME		4/1/2010 WIP Conference with R. Elli re: Ludwig claims (.3); reviewed document request and analysis of issues re: same (1.2); email to B. Purcell re: document request (.1); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.3); multiple conferences with M. Gensberg re: document and cash collateral issues (.4); conference with M. Gensberg and G. Ostfeld re: cash collateral proposal (.3); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	1064.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 178

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
454357	TIME		4/1/2010 WIP Further discussion with A. Guon and D. Leibowitz re: 2004 exam motion.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	95.00
454349	TIME		4/1/2010 WIP Review Ludwig/Levinson Rule 2004 motion (.5); phone call with M. Gensburg to discuss scope (.3) and phone call with D. Leibowitz to discuss scope (.2).	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.00 0.00	475.00 T@13	475.00
454502	TIME		4/2/2010 WIP Conference with B. Purcell re: document requests (.3); conference with M. Gensburg re: same (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
455064	TIME		4/5/2010 WIP Email with A. Guon re: Pioneer issue	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.10 0.00	475.00 T@13	47.50
454827	TIME		4/5/2010 WIP Conference with T. Banich re: Ludwig complaint (.3); conference with R. Elli re: Ludwig transaction (.4); conferences (2) with B. Purcell re: discovery issues (.4); examined transcript from lift stay hearing (1.5); reviewed Ludwig documents in preparation for declaratory and fraudulent transfer compliant (1.6); prepared complaint against Ludwig, Levinson and FPC (4.6)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	8.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	3344.00
455471	TIME		4/5/2010 WIP Conferred with A. Guon re potential adversary against Ludwig.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
455260	TIME		4/6/2010 WIP Analysis of issues re: Ludwig's lift stay testimony (.6); research re: judicial estoppel (1.4); research re: 2004 examination (.6); prepared objection to 2004 motion (.8); conference with R. Elli re: FPC issues (.2); examined complaint filed by FPC and related entities (.5); conference with D. Leibowitz	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	4.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	1558.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 179

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
		re: same (.2)			
455414	TIME 4/6/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
		Revise draft objection to Rule 2004 objection			
455413	TIME 4/6/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	475.00 T@13	285.00
		Review Ludwig/FPC adversary (.3); discuss strategy with A. Guon (.3).			
455577	TIME 4/7/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.40 0.00	475.00 T@13	190.00
		Review adversary complaint filed by First Portland			
455938	TIME 4/7/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	912.00
		Reviewed response to FPC Rule 2004 motion (.7); reviewed FPC complaint (.8); considered strategies re contested cash-collateral issues and potential responses to FPC complaint (.9).			
455575	TIME 4/7/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.80 0.00	475.00 T@13	855.00
		Read transcript of November lift stay hearing (1.5) and discuss approach today's hearing with A. Guon (.3).			
455944	TIME 4/8/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	5.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	2204.00
		Conducted legal research re judicial estoppel issues and reviewed transcript of lift-stay proceedings and other background materials (4.9); considered potential dismissal strategies for FPC adversary (.9).			
455646	TIME 4/8/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	3.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	1330.00
		Conference with T. Banich re strategy for litigation with Ludwig entities (.5); conference with B. Purcell re: discovery issues (.3); conferences with G. Ostfeld re: settlement proposal and meeting (.5); analysis of legal issues avoidance of claims (.9); email to D. Leibowitz re: same (.2); examined draft 2004 order (.1); conference with J. Brand re: same			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 180

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			(.4); conference with D. Leibowitz re: strategy and settlement issues for FPC litigation (.4); examined email from R. Elli re: Ludwig resignation (.1); email to and from B. Barrett re: FPC claims (.1).				
455746	TIME		4/9/2010 WIP Conference with R. Elli re: claims against Ludwig entities (.3); conference with B. Purcell re: FPC analysis, discovery and related issues (.7); email to M. Gensburg re: discovery (.1); email to and from G. Ostfeld re: settlement (.1); analysis of legal issues re: judicial estoppel (1.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	912.00
455952	TIME		4/9/2010 WIP Considered strategies and conducted research re potential motion to dismiss FPC adversary.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	5.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	1976.00
456656	TIME		4/9/2010 WIP Continued researching judicial estoppel issues.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	5.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	1976.00
455852	TIME		4/9/2010 WIP Review email re: terms for meeting and discuss with A. Guon	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	95.00
455997	TIME		4/12/2010 WIP Conference with M. Gensburg, G. Ostfeld and J. Brand re: FPC's objection to settlement procedures and 2004 order (.3); conference with J. Brand re: same (.3); email from G. Ostfeld and to J. Brand re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	266.00
467175	TIME		4/13/2010 WIP Conference with B. Purcell re: document production for FPC (.4); conference with G. Ostfeld re: same (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00
456672	TIME		4/14/2010 WIP Considered protective order issues and edited	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 181

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			same.				
456321	TIME		4/14/2010 WIP Prepared protective order (2.0); conference with T. Banich re: same (.2); email to G. Ostfeld re: disposition notice (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	874.00
456438	TIME		4/15/2010 WIP Conference with J. Brand re: document production to G. Ostfeld (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
456700	TIME		4/16/2010 WIP Drafted and edited motion to dismiss.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	3.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	1254.00
457286	TIME		4/17/2010 WIP Continued drafting motion to dismiss.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	3.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	1330.00
457288	TIME		4/19/2010 WIP Continued working on motion to dismiss and conducting legal research re same (1.5); reviewed settlement proposal (1.1).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	988.00
456709	TIME		4/19/2010 WIP Initial review and analyses of Ludwig offer (1.4); conference with G. Ostfeld and M. Gensberg re: 2004 and settlement (.2); conference with J. Brand re: same (.1); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.3); email to and from B. Purcell re: document production (.1); examined transcript from 4/7 hearing (.8); email to M. Gensburg re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	3.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	1140.00
456818	TIME		4/19/2010 WIP Review and analyze settlement proposal	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.80 0.00	475.00 T@13	380.00



7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 182

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
457297	TIME 4/20/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	9.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	3648.00
	Continued drafting and editing motion to dismiss.				
458152	TIME 4/20/2010 WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	6.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	1798.00
	Legal research in connection with judicial estoppel arguments for motion to dismiss.				
456887	TIME 4/20/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.00 0.00	475.00 T@13	475.00
	Phone call with D. Leibowitz re: proposal received and alternatives (.8); discuss with A. Guon (.2).				
456842	TIME 4/20/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	684.00
	Conference with R. Elli re: document production and related issues (.2); conference with J. Brand re: information provided to Laury (.1); conference with B. Purcell re: same (.2); reviewed subpoenas issued in connection with lift stay motion and transcript from 11/4 hearing re: same (.4); analysis of additional judicial estoppel case law (.3); analyzed issues for settlement conference (.6); email to N. Rugg re: documents (.1).				
457030	TIME 4/21/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.40 0.00	475.00 T@13	190.00
	Phone call with A. Guon and B. Purcell re: proposal and response for meeting				
457302	TIME 4/21/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	1026.00
	Edited motion to dismiss (1.9); conferred with I. Bodenstein and A. Guon re same (.5); drafted correspondence to D. Leibowitz re draft motion (.1); reviewed First Portland edits to protective order (.2).				
457032	TIME 4/21/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.80 0.00	475.00 T@13	380.00
	Review TGB draft motion to dismiss complaint (.5); and discuss judicial estoppel argument with TGB (.3).				

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 183

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
467124	TIME	JWG	0.70	290.00	203.00
4/21/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review of Ludwig motion re: judicial estoppel. (.7)		LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
457188	TIME	IB	4.00	475.00	1900.00
4/22/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Meet with B. Purcell and A. Guon and D. Leibowitz to prepare for settlement conference with Ludwig et al (.7); meeting at Greenberg Traurig with L. Ludwig, T. Laury, M. Gensberg and G. Ostfeld to discuss Settlement (3.0); reconvene with Purcell and Leibowitz to discuss follow-up (.3).		LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
457310	TIME	TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
4/22/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conferred with A. Guon re results of settlement meeting and impact on litigation of adversary proceeding.		LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
457178	TIME	AJG	4.30	380.00	1634.00
4/22/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
meeting with B. Purcell re: strategy for today's meeting (1.0); meeting with M. Gensburg, G. Ostfeld, T. Laury, D. Leibowitz and I. Bodenstein re: settlement conference (3.0); meet with D. Leibowitz and B. Purcell after settlement conference. (.3).		LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
457556	TIME	AJG	1.40	380.00	532.00
4/26/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Emails to and from G. Ostfeld re: FP Entities objections to lease disposition motion (.1); reviewed orders re: same (.4); conference with G. Ostfeld re: same (.1); started review of documents to be produced to FP Entities (.8).		LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
458243	TIME	TGB	0.80	380.00	304.00
4/26/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Reviewed and edited protective order.		LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
457634	TIME	AJG	1.70	380.00	646.00
4/27/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Revised draft of protective order (.4); email to G. Ostfeld re: same (.1); continued review of documents to be produced (.9); conference with S.		LUDWIG & LEVINSON			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 184

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
Herndon re: same (.3).					
458251	TIME 4/27/2010 WIP Worked on protective order.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
458261	TIME 4/28/2010 WIP Considered answer date and need for motion for a protective order.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
457863	TIME 4/29/2010 WIP Phone call with B. Purcell and A. Guon re: production of documents to Ludwig(.4); review potential revenue analysis being produced (.3).	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.70 0.00	475.00 T@13	332.50
457971	TIME 4/30/2010 WIP Review form of agreed protective order	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
458810	TIME 5/3/2010 WIP Examined revenue analysis from S. Csar (.2); conference with S. Csar and B. Purcell re: revenue analysis (.9)conferences (2) with G. Ostfeld re: settlement discussions and extension of answer date(.3); conference with B. Purcell re: settlement issues (.2); email to G. Ostfeld re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	570.00
458829	TIME 5/4/2010 WIP Prepared motion to extend answer date (.5); examined settlement proposal from Ludwig (1.0); email to D. Leibowitz re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	608.00
459188	TIME 5/5/2010 WIP Conference with B. Purcell re: settlement proposal (.4); conference with R. Elli re: same (.3); continued analysis of settlement proposal (.9); conference with B. Purcell, R. Elli and S. Csar re: settlement proposal (1.2); conference with G. Ostfeld re: same (.5); email to B. Purcell and R. Elli re: same (.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	3.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	1406.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 185

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
459394	TIME	IB	0.50	475.00	237.50
5/5/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review Settlement proposal	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
459669	TIME	AJG	2.20	380.00	836.00
5/6/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with B. Purcell re: tomorrow's meeting (.3); conferences (2) with G. Ostfeld re: same and discovery production (.4); conference with R. Elli and B. Purcell re: preparation for tomorrow's meeting (.5); conference with I. Bodenstein re: planning for tomorrow's meeting (.2); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.8).	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
459725	TIME	IB	0.20	475.00	95.00
5/6/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Discuss proposal with A. Guon.	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
459914	TIME	TGB	0.30	380.00	114.00
5/7/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Considered FPC judicial estoppel issues and evidence re T. Laury knowledge of unconsolidated financial data.	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
459821	TIME	IB	0.30	475.00	142.50
5/7/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Phone call with G. Ostfeld re: disposition notice	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
459797	TIME	AJG	2.90	380.00	1102.00
5/7/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Prepared for (.4) and attended conference with I. Bodenstein, D. Leibowitz, B. Purcell M. Gensburg, G. Ostfeld, T. Laury and L. Ludwig re: new settlement proposal (2.5).	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
459820	TIME	IB	2.50	475.00	1187.50
5/7/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Meet with D. Leibowitz, A. Guon, M. Gensberg, G. Ostfeld, L. Ludwig, T. Laury re: servicing proposal	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
460019	TIME	AJG	1.10	380.00	418.00
5/10/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined and analyzed FPC entities draft objection to disposition (.6); conference with G.	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 186

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
460095	TIME	AJG	5.10	380.00	1938.00
5/11/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Prepared for hearings (.3); and attended hearing on LUDWIG & LEVINSON motion for protective order and motion to extend answer date (1.1); conference with M. Gensburg and G. Ostfeld re: discovery and cash collateral issues (.6); conference with D. Leibowitz and I. Bodenstein re: same (.4); multiple conferences (4) with B. Purcell re: FPC discovery and settlement issues (1.0); conference with B. Purcell and G. Ostfeld re: settlement (.2); conference with M. Gensberg, G. Ostfeld, L. Ludwig and B. Purcell re: settlement (.5); conference with M. Gensberg re: additional discovery and settlement issues (.5); conference with T. Banich re: filing motion to dismiss (.2).					
460538	TIME	TGB	1.40	380.00	532.00
5/11/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Considered strategies in connection with FPC objection to disposition and use of cash collateral (.3); finalized, cite-checked and filed motion to dismiss FPC adversary and drafted proposed order re same (1.1).					
460549	TIME	TGB	0.50	380.00	190.00
5/12/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Considered potential privilege issues in FPC adversary (.2); refiled motion to dismiss (.3).					
460163	TIME	AJG	1.40	380.00	532.00
5/12/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with B. Purcell re: discovery issues (.2); review of discovery issues (.4); conferences with B. Purcell re: same (.4); conference with M. Gensberg and G. Ostfeld re: discovery and cash collateral objection (.4);					
460305	TIME	IB	0.30	475.00	142.50
5/12/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Discuss document production with A. Guon					

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 187

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
460494	5/14/2010	WIP	Examined email from S. Herndon re: LeasePlus (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
461322	5/17/2010	WIP	Conferred with A. Guon re May 19 hearing in FPC adversary (.2); telephone conference with J. Brand re same (.2); followed up with G. Ostfeld re same (.1).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
460783	5/18/2010	WIP	Conference with S. Herndon and B. Purcell re: LeasePlus information requested by Ludwig (.6); conference with M. Gensburg re: discovery (.3); conference with R. Elli and D. Keenan re: state and municipal sale and personal property tax returns (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	418.00
461333	5/19/2010	WIP	Considered Rule 2004 and cash-collateral discovery requests from FPC and strategies for responding to same.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
461342	5/20/2010	WIP	Conference call with G. Ostfeld and A. Guon re discovery issues.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	304.00
461023	5/20/2010	WIP	Prepared for conference with G. Ostfeld (.3); conference with G. Ostfeld re discovery and litigation (.6); obtained case law re: assignments (.6).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	570.00
461030	5/20/2010	WIP	Review B. Barrett revised language for WSB disposition order to resolve Ludwig objection (.2); discuss with A. Guon (.1).	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50

7/30/2010  
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
 Slip Listing

Page 188

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
461173	TIME	IB	0.60	475.00	285.00
5/21/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review Ludwig revisions to WSB disposition order from G. Ostfeld (.3) and B. Barret (.1) and discuss with A. Guon (.2).					
461153	TIME	AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
5/21/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Email to G. Ostfeld re: LeasePlus data production (.3).					
462776	TIME	TGB	0.40	380.00	152.00
5/24/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Considered FPC edits to cash-collateral order and strategies relating to discovery and judicial-estoppel dismissal motion.					
461494	TIME	IB	0.20	475.00	95.00
5/24/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Phone call with D. Leibowitz and A. Guon re:preparation of counter-proposal					
461371	TIME	AJG	2.10	380.00	798.00
5/24/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conferences (2) with D. Keenan re: tax returns (.2); conference with T. Banich re: motion to dismiss (.2); conference with D. Leibowitz re: FPC settlement and D&O proposals (.6); conference with G. Ostfeld re: settlement of cash collateral issues (.2); initial review of state sale tax returns (.5); examined email from L. Ludwig re: LeasePlus data (.1); conference with R. Elli re: settlement and tax issues (.3).					
461493	TIME	IB	1.30	475.00	617.50
5/24/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review leasing cases dealing with separation of perfection in leases (chattel paper) and equipment (goods); perfection in reversionary interests in leases and estoppel to challenge valid security interest in leases					
461797	TIME	IB	0.20	475.00	95.00
5/25/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review stipulation to resolve disposition notice					

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 189

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
		objection			
462208	TIME 5/26/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	3.00 0.00	380.00 T@13	1140.00
		Conference with D. Leibowitz, R. Elli, B. Purcell, S. Herndon and S. Csar at IFC offices re: FPC proposal and M&T issues (2.5); conference with B. Purcell re: additional issues related to FPC settlement (.5)			
462411	TIME 5/27/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	456.00
		Conference with D. Leibowitz re: settlement proposal (.2); reviewed email memo from D. Leibowitz re: settlement (.2); prepared settlement proposal (.8)			
462384	TIME 5/27/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	475.00 T@13	285.00
		Review Ludwig proposal (.4) and discuss counter-proposal with A. Guon (.2).			
462488	TIME 5/28/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	475.00 T@13	285.00
		Review and revise draft of counter-proposal to Ludwig (.4); discuss with A. Guon (.2).			
462825	TIME 5/28/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00
		Reviewed motion to compel trustee to conduct discovery and conferred with A. Guon re strategies in response to same (.5); exchanged correspondence with A. Guon re same (.1).			
462436	TIME 5/28/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	684.00
		conferences (2) with B. Purcell re: FPC offer (.2); revised settlement letter (1.0); conference with I. Bodenstein re: comments to proposal (.3); conference with G. Ostfeld re: same (.1); conference with T. Banich re: motion to compel discovery (.2).			
462752	TIME 5/29/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.90 0.00	475.00 T@13	427.50



7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC

Slip Listing

Page 190

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Emails with A. Guon (.2) and D. Leibowitz (.1) re: counter-proposal; review counter-proposal and send to A. Guon for transmittal (.4); phone call with A.Guon re: transmittal (.2).	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
463008	TIME			AJG	1.50	380.00	570.00
	6/1/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conferences (2) with G. Ostfeld re: settlement (.9); conference with B. Purcell re: same (.4); examined email from D. Leibowitz re: same (.1); examined motion to compel (.3); conference with D. Leibowitz re: settlement (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
463066	TIME			IB	0.30	475.00	142.50
	6/1/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Review Ludwig response to settlement proposal (.1); and discuss with A. Guon (.2).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
463377	TIME			AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
	6/2/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conference with D. Leibowitz re: litigation and settlement (.3); conference with G. Ostfeld re: same (.2).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
464327	TIME			AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
	6/7/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Email to and from G. Ostfeld re: claims summary (.1); conference with J. Brand re: same (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
464669	TIME			AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
	6/9/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Examined NorthSide Motion to intervene.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
464805	TIME			IB	0.40	475.00	190.00
	6/10/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Review NorthSide motion to intervene	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
464715	TIME			AJG	0.40	380.00	152.00
	6/10/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conference with B. Purcell re: update on FPC litigation (.3); conference with G. Ostfeld re: NorthSide motion to intervene (.1).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 191

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
464786	TIME 6/10/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	0.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	228.00
Multiple conferences with A. Guon re response to FPC motion to compel commencement of discovery (.4); conferred with J. Guzzardo re research for same (.2).					
465132	TIME 6/11/2010 WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	4.60 0.00	290.00 T@13	1334.00
Review of L&L motion to compel. (.5) Discussion with T. Banich re: go forwards and strategies for same. (.6) Legal research and drafting of objection to motion to compel. (3.5)					
464879	TIME 6/11/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	532.00
Multiple conferences with A. Guon and J. Guzzardo re response to motion to compel discovery (.6); reviewed objection to motion to dismiss adversary proceeding and conferred with A. Guon and J. Guzzardo re arguments in response thereto (.8).					
464834	TIME 6/11/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	532.00
Examined and analyzed NorthSide's motion to intervene (.3); conference with R. Elli re: production of documents (.2); initial review of response to motion to dismiss (.3); conference with T. Banich re: strategy for same (.6).					
465148	TIME 6/12/2010 WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	4.10 0.00	290.00 T@13	1189.00
Legal research for reply to motion to compel.					
464920	TIME 6/14/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	646.00
Examined response to motion to dismiss (1.1); review claims information requested by G. Ostfeld (.2); emails to and from G. Ostfeld re: same (.2); conference with H. Korenthal re: response to motion to dismiss (.2)					
466259	TIME 6/14/2010 WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	6.90 0.00	290.00 T@13	2001.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 192

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Legal research and drafting of riders in connection with L&L motion to compel.	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
465060	TIME			AJG	4.00	380.00	1520.00
	6/15/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conference with H. Korenthal re: motion to dismiss affidavits (.5); conference with T. Banich re: reply to motion to dismiss (.3); reviewed motion to compel (.3); continued factual investigation of Ludwig and Laury allegations (2.9).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
465435	TIME			TGB	1.10	380.00	418.00
	6/15/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Considered responses to motion to compel participation in discovery (.8); conducted legal research re New Hampshire v. Maine and drafted correspondence re same (.3).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
466266	TIME			JWG	4.40	290.00	1276.00
	6/15/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Legal research and drafting of riders to response to L&L Motion to Compel.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
465217	TIME			AJG	0.70	380.00	266.00
	6/16/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Conference with B. Purcell re: discussions with Ludwig (.4); email from G. Ostfeld re: possible inadvertent production of data (.1); conference with G. Ostfeld re: same (.2)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
466271	TIME			JWG	4.10	290.00	1189.00
	6/16/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Legal research and drafting of riders in connection with standards of 12(b)(6) Motion to Dismiss.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
465447	TIME			TGB	0.50	380.00	190.00
	6/16/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Considered additional arguments in response to motion to compel and in further support of motion to dismiss.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
465458	TIME			TGB	2.10	380.00	798.00
	6/17/2010			Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP		Telephone conference with A. Guon re response to motion to compel (.2); drafted and edited objection	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 193

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			to FPC motion to compel discovery and exchanged correspondence with A. Guon re same (1.9).				
465468	6/18/2010	TIME	WIP Continued drafting, editing and conducting legal research re objection to motion to compel (9.2); telephone conference with R. Elli re declaration (.2).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	9.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	3572.00
466176	6/21/2010	TIME	WIP Edited, finalized and filed objection to motion to compel trustee to participate in discovery (2.2).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	836.00
465488	6/21/2010	TIME	WIP Reviewed and revised response to motion to compel (.6); examined email to G. Ostfeld re: settlement and claim issues (.1); conference with G. Ostfeld re: status hearing (.2); examined Illinois priority tax claim (.1); conference with T. Banich re: discovery production issues (.7).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	646.00
466177	6/21/2010	TIME	WIP Drafted, edited and researched reply brief in support of motion to dismiss complaint (6.9); multiple conferences with A. Guon re same (.7)	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	7.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	2888.00
466281	6/21/2010	TIME	WIP Legal research and review and edits of reply to L&LLUDWIG & LEVINSON Motion to compel and reply in support of motion to dismiss L&L adversary.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	5.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	1537.00
465857	6/22/2010	TIME	WIP Confer with T. Banich regarding privity and estoppel (.1); Conduct westlaw research on parties in privity for estoppel purposes and review and analyze cases regarding same (1.2)	KAB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.30 0.00	290.00 T@13	377.00
465525	6/22/2010	TIME	4:26 PM WIP Conference with B. Purcell re: discussions with	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	3.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	1292.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 194

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
		Ludwig and settlement (.4); reviewed emails re: First Portland (.3); conference with R. Elli re: same (.3); reviewed and revised reply in support of motion for summary judgment (2.4).			
466183	TIME 6/22/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR Continued drafting, editing and researching reply in support of motion to dismiss complaint (10.2); conferred with K. Bacher re research tasks and results (.2).	10.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	3952.00
465653	TIME 6/22/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR Examined rule re: motion to intervene (.1); email to L. Natchinson re: same (.1); conference with L. Natchinson and T. Magill re: continuing hearing (.2).	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
465800	TIME 6/23/2010 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR Discuss status of litigation and negotiations with A. Guon and T. Banich.	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
465725	TIME 6/23/2010 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR Prepared for (1.3) and attended omnibus hearings/Pioneer assets and liabilities (1.8); conference with T. Banich re: litigation strategy relating to FPC (1.0); conference with T. Banich and H. Korenthal re: FPC adversary proceeding (.5); reviewed and analyzed documents related to litigation (1.6); conference with G. Gensberg re: settlement issues (.4).	6.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	2508.00
466188	TIME 6/23/2010 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR Prepared for argument on motion to compel (2.5); attended omnibus hearing and argued against motion to compel trustee to participate in discovery (1.8); conferred with A. Guon re Laury/Ludwig knowledge of FPC/Pioneer assets/liabilities and strategies for obtaining evidence of same (1.0); conference call with H. Korenthal and A. Guon re same (.5); reviewed and analyzed documents pertaining to FPC adversary (.6); telephone conference with R. Elli re T. Laury issues (.3).	6.70 0.00	380.00 T@13	2546.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 195

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
	Posting Status	Client Matter		Bill Status	
	Description				
465929	TIME	AJG	2.30	380.00	874.00
	6/24/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with T. Banich, R. Elli, B. Purcell and ILUDWIG & LEVINSON Bodenstein re: FPC investigation (.7); conference with J. Brand re: same (.1); conference with G. Ostfeld re: new settlement proposal (.5); conference with B. Purcell re: same (.6); analysis of issues re: settlement issues (.4).				
465968	TIME	IB	0.70	475.00	332.50
	6/24/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Analysis of proof issues re: information given to T. LUDWIG & LEVINSON Laury (.3) and discuss with A. Guon, T. Banich, R. Elli and D. Goodman (.4)				
466194	TIME	TGB	8.00	380.00	3040.00
	6/24/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Met with B. Purcell, R. Elli and others re Ludwlg/Laury knowledge of FPC/Pioneer assets/liabilities including travel to and from Northfield (7.6); conference call with IFC team re D. Keenan issues (.4).				
466159	TIME	IB	0.20	475.00	95.00
	6/25/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review and consider email from A. Guon re: LUDWIG & LEVINSON Ludwig revised proposal				
466198	TIME	TGB	3.10	380.00	1178.00
	6/25/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Investigated Ludwig/Laury knowledge of FPC/Pioneer assets and liabilities (2.3); telephone interview of D. Lovejoy re same (.6); telephone conference with G. Murphy re D. Keenan issues (.2).				
466003	TIME	AJG	2.20	380.00	836.00
	6/25/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Conference with T. Banich and F. Lovejoy re: PFC LUDWIG & LEVINSON tax issues (.4); conference with B.Purcell re: same (.2); continued investigation of facts related to FPC litigation (1.6)				
466223	TIME	AJG	2.60	380.00	988.00
	6/28/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 196

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			examined email from G. Ostfeld re: pending motion to dismiss, settlement proposal and objection cash collateral (1.0); conference with J. Brand re: same (.3); conference with R. Elli re: continued investigation of FPC (.7); conference with D. Leibowitz and T. Banich re: FPC settlement offer (.6).	LUDWIG & LEVINSON			
467565	6/28/2010	TIME WIP	Considered potential settlement terms and strategies (.5); analyzed and reviewed FPC adversary litigation strategies (.5); conference call with D. Leibowitz and A. Guon re FPC litigation and settlement strategies (.6).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	1.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	608.00
466439	6/29/2010	TIME WIP	Conference with G. Ostfeld and J. Brand re: settlement discussions (.3); prepared notes from meeting (.2); conferences (3) with B. Purcell re: settlement issues (.6); analysis of issues re: settlement (.3); additional conference with G. Ostfeld re: settlement (.3); email to D. Leibowitz re: same (.4); examined emails and related documents regarding FPC (1.6); e-mails to and D. Leibowitz re: meetings with IFC Staff (.2); email to B. Purcell, R. Elli and S. Herndon re: same (.2); conference with D. Leibowitz re: same (.2);	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	4.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	1634.00
467587	6/29/2010	TIME WIP	Drafted outline in preparation for June 30 hearing on motion to dismiss (3.6); considered potential settlement and potential evidence relating to judicial-estoppel issue (.8); reviewed documents gathered by R. Elli re T. Laury's knowledge of FPC issues and considered strategies re same (1.2); reviewed R. Elli's analysis of T. Laury and L. Ludwig affidavits (1.0).	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	6.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	2508.00
468154	6/30/2010	TIME WIP	Court appearance re: motion to dismiss adversary proceeding (1.5); conference with P. Purcell re: settlement (.6).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR LUDWIG & LEVINSON	2.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	798.00

7/30/2010  
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
 Slip Listing

Page 197

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Client		Bill Status	
Description		Matter			
467603	TIME	TGB	4.20	380.00	1596.00
6/30/2010		Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Prepared for hearing on motion to dismiss (2.1); attended hearing and argued trustee's motion to dismiss adversary proceeding (1.5); considered future FPC strategies (.6).					
Total: LUDWIG & LEVINSON					
		Billable	324.00		121374.50
		Unbillable	0.00		0.00
		Total	324.00		121374.50
<u>Nickname 1: MOTION TO DISMISS</u>					
433074	TIME	AJG	0.30	365.00	109.50
11/3/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Conference with J. Seiger re: dismissal motion (.3) MOTION TO DISMISS					
433663	TIME	IB	0.50	465.00	232.50
11/4/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review First Chicago motion to dismiss MOTION TO DISMISS					
434875	TIME	IB	0.20	465.00	93.00
11/13/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Phone call from D. Leibowitz re: defending the motion to dismiss.					
435818	TIME	JWG	3.30	270.00	891.00
11/16/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Review of motion to dismiss, legal research for objection to motion to dismiss.					
435090	TIME	AJG	3.70	365.00	1350.50
11/16/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Examined motion to dismiss chapter 7 case (.5); conference with J. Guzzardo re: responding to motion to dismiss (.3); examined and analyzed case federal and state case law and bankruptcy code re: authority to file petition and amendments (2.9) MOTION TO DISMISS					
435110	TIME	AJG	1.30	365.00	474.50
11/17/2009		Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
WIP		LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
Analysis of arguments for motion to dismiss (.5); conference with D. Leibowitz re: motion to dismiss MOTION TO DISMISS					



7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 198

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
	Posting Status	Client		Bill Status	
	Description	Matter			
		(.3); conference with J. Guzzardo re: arguments for response to motion to dismiss (.4); e-mails to and from J. Brand re: same (.1).			
435273	TIME 11/17/2009	IB Legal Services	0.20 0.00	465.00 T@14	93.00
	WIP Emails with A. Guon re: motion to dismiss	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS			
467151	TIME 11/17/2009	TGB Legal Services	0.30 0.00	365.00 T@14	109.50
	WIP Conferred with A. Guon re motion to dismiss bankruptcy case and responses thereto (.3)	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS			
437914	TIME 11/17/2009	MAH Legal Services	1.50 0.00	180.00 T@13	270.00
	WIP Obtained and shepardizing citations from First Chicago's Motion to Dismiss per J. Guzzardo's request.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS			
435819	TIME 11/17/2009	JWG Legal Services	7.80 0.00	270.00 T@14	2106.00
	WIP Legal research for objection to motion to dismiss.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS			
435325	TIME 11/18/2009	AJG Legal Services	3.90 0.00	365.00 T@14	1423.50
	WIP Conference with P. Barr re: service of motion to dismiss (.2); conference with J. Brand re: service list (.2); conference with J. Brand and clerk's office re: motion to dismiss (.2); examined and analyzed case law cited in First Chicago brief and additional research re: petition amendments (2.9); conference with B. Barrett re: motion to dismiss (.2); examined WSB's response to motion to dismiss (.2).	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS			
435824	TIME 11/18/2009	JWG Legal Services	9.40 0.00	270.00 T@14	2538.00
	WIP Legal research and drafting of objection to Motion to Dismiss.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS			
435828	TIME 11/19/2009	JWG Legal Services	4.70 0.00	270.00 T@14	1269.00
	WIP Drafting of and edits to objection to Motion to Dismiss.	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 199

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
435612	11/19/2009	TIME	WIP Revise draft of Trustee's Response to Motion to Dismiss.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	2.00 0.00	465.00 T@14	930.00
435611	11/19/2009	TIME	WIP Phone call with R. Friedman re: First Chicago motion to dismiss	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.30 0.00	465.00 T@14	139.50
435418	11/19/2009	TIME	WIP Conference with J. Sieger re: motion to dismiss (.1); examined draft First Chicago motion to limit service (.2); examined first Chicago preference payments (.1); conference with J. Brand re: same (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.60 0.00	365.00 T@14	219.00
435746	11/20/2009	TIME	WIP Revise final draft of Trustee's Response to First Chicago motion to dismiss.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.80 0.00	465.00 T@14	372.00
435745	11/20/2009	TIME	WIP Revise 2nd draft of Trustee's response to First Chicago Motion to Dismiss	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	1.50 0.00	465.00 T@14	697.50
435656	11/20/2009	TIME	WIP Continued to revise response to motion to dismiss (2.6); conference with P. Barr re: motion to dismiss (.2); conference with R. Elli re: motion to dismiss (.2); conferences (2) with D. Leibowitz re: same (.4); email to and from J. Alwin re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	3.50 0.00	365.00 T@14	1277.50
435834	11/20/2009	TIME	WIP Final edits and coordination of filing of objection to motion to dismiss.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	3.60 0.00	270.00 T@14	972.00
435841	11/22/2009	TIME	WIP Review CoActiv and Lakeland joinders to First	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.30 0.00	465.00 T@14	139.50

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 200

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
	Chicago motion to dismiss				
435842	TIME 11/22/2009 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.80 0.00	465.00 T@14	372.00
	Review Levinson and Ludwig(.4) and West Suburban (.4) Responses in Opposition to First Chicago Motion to Dismiss	MOTION TO DISMISS			
436062	TIME 11/23/2009 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.50 0.00	465.00 T@14	232.50
	Discuss Preparation for Motion to Dismiss and Preliminary Injunction hearings with A. Guon, D. Goodman and J. Guzzardo	MOTION TO DISMISS			
436362	TIME 11/23/2009 WIP	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.70 0.00	365.00 T@14	255.50
	Reviewed responses to motion to dismiss bankruptcy case.	MOTION TO DISMISS			
436007	TIME 11/23/2009 WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.80 0.00	365.00 T@14	292.00
	Examined WSB's response to motion to dismiss (.2); examined Ludwig's response to motion to dismiss (.2); examined joinder of Lakeland and CoActiv (.1); examined e-mail from W. Dorsey and to D. Leibowitz re: request for information (.2); e-mail to and from J. Brand re: subpoena from First Chicago (.1).	MOTION TO DISMISS			
436337	TIME 11/24/2009 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	1.00 0.00	465.00 T@14	465.00
	Begin preparation for on Motion to Dismiss Argument	MOTION TO DISMISS			
436479	TIME 11/25/2009 WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.40 0.00	465.00 T@14	186.00
	Begin review of First Chicago reply on motion to dismiss	MOTION TO DISMISS			
436488	TIME 11/25/2009 WIP	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	3.20 0.00	270.00 T@14	864.00
	Review of reply to motion to dismiss and legal research in connection with same. Discussions with A. Guon and J. Brand regarding strategies and go-forwards in connection with same.	MOTION TO DISMISS			

7/30/2010  
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
 Slip Listing

Page 201

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status	Description	Client Matter		Bill Status	
436380	TIME 11/25/2009	AJG Legal Services	0.80 0.00	365.00 T@14	292.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined Debtor's joinder to motion to dismiss (.1); prepared response to Dorsey e-mail re: financial report (.5); e-mails to and from D. Leibowitz re: same (.2).				
436510	TIME 11/27/2009	IB Legal Services	1.50 0.00	465.00 T@14	697.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Prepare for hearing on motion to dismiss				
436511	TIME 11/28/2009	IB Legal Services	2.00 0.00	465.00 T@14	930.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Prepare for hearing on motion to dismiss				
436839	TIME 11/29/2009	AJG Legal Services	1.10 0.00	365.00 T@14	401.50
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined First Chicago's reply to motion to dismiss (.7); e-mail to D. Leibowitz re: same (.4).				
437068	TIME 11/30/2009	IB Legal Services	1.00 0.00	465.00 T@14	465.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review cases cited for motion to dismiss argumentMOTION TO DISMISS				
437069	TIME 11/30/2009	IB Legal Services	0.40 0.00	465.00 T@14	186.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Revise draft of sur-reply on motion to dismiss				
437060	TIME 11/30/2009	JWG Legal Services	1.20 0.00	270.00 T@14	324.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Discussion with A. Guon and I. Bodenstein re: additional edits to sur-reply and Notice of Filing / Emergency Motion for Leave to file sur-reply (.4). Edits to same and distribution to team for internal review (.8).				
437070	TIME 11/30/2009	IB Legal Services	0.20 0.00	465.00 T@14	93.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review need for sur-reply with Trustee				
437950	TIME 11/30/2009	MAH Legal Services	0.40 0.00	180.00 T@13	72.00
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Prepared set of citations from motion to dismiss forMOTION TO DISMISS				

7/30/2010  
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
 Slip Listing

Page 202

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
I. Bodenstein.							
437048	TIME			JWG	4.90	270.00	1323.00
	11/30/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Call with D. Liebowitz re: surreply to motion to dismiss (.8) Legal research, drafting of and edits to surreply and motion for leave to file surreply. (4.1)	MOTION TO DISMISS			
436939	TIME			IB	3.00	465.00	1395.00
	11/30/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Review First Chicago Omnibus Reply, cases and exhibits re: prepare for motion to dismiss hearing	MOTION TO DISMISS			
437249	TIME			IB	3.50	465.00	1627.50
	12/1/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Prepare for hearing on motion to dismiss.	MOTION TO DISMISS			
437259	TIME			JWG	1.80	270.00	486.00
	12/1/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Edits to sur-reply brief, and coordination of filing and distribution of same.	MOTION TO DISMISS			
438068	TIME			TGB	0.30	365.00	109.50
	12/2/2009			Legal Services	0.30	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR		No Charge	
			Conferred with I. Bodenstein and J. Guzzardo re hearing on motion to dismiss case and potential new preference adversary proceeding.	MOTION TO DISMISS			
437563	TIME			IB	4.00	465.00	1860.00
	12/2/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Prepare for argument on Motion to Dismiss.	MOTION TO DISMISS			
437564	TIME			IB	2.50	465.00	1162.50
	12/2/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Attend and argue motion to dismiss hearing.	MOTION TO DISMISS			
439556	TIME			IB	0.40	465.00	186.00
	12/16/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
			Read Judge Manning opinion denying motion to dismiss.	MOTION TO DISMISS			
439512	TIME			AJG	2.30	365.00	839.50
	12/16/2009			Legal Services	0.00	T@14	
	WIP			LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 203

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Examined Askounis motion to dismiss (.2); prepared for (1.0) and attended hearing re: First Chicago adversary and motion for turnover (.9); examined order denying motion to dismiss (.3).	MOTION TO DISMISS			
439648	12/16/2009	WIP	Reviewed order denying motion to dismiss and conferred with I. Bodenstein and J. Guzzardo re same.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.50 0.50	365.00 T@14 No Charge	182.50
442922	1/4/2010	WIP	Review Askounis & Darcy Motion to Supplement their Motion to Dismiss	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.40 0.00	475.00 T@13	190.00
443013	1/5/2010	WIP	Review opinion denying Askounis & Darcy Motion to Dismiss	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
445179	1/5/2010	WIP	Court appearance re: Askounis motion to dismiss (.6); examined order denying motion to dismiss (.4); analysis of issues on appeal (.3); e-mail to and from D. Leibowitz re: same (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	1.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	532.00
448086	2/19/2010	WIP	Finalized motions to consolidate and stay and prepared same for filing (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
448178	2/20/2010	WIP	Review Askounis & Darcy Appeal Brief	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.50 0.00	475.00 T@13	237.50
449323	2/21/2010	WIP	Drafting of order authorizing filing of sur-reply in connection with Motion to Dismiss litigation.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	58.00

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 204

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
449327	2/22/2010	TIME	WIP Final proof of order approving filing of sur-reply.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	58.00
451804	3/7/2010	TIME	WIP Drafting of sur-reply and motion for leave to file same. (6.1)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	6.10 0.00	290.00 T@13	1769.00
451810	3/8/2010	TIME	WIP Edits to Sur-reply and motion for leave to file sur-reply. (3.5)	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	3.50 0.00	290.00 T@13	1015.00
451811	3/9/2010	TIME	WIP Legal research for and edits to Sur-reply and motion for leave to file Sur-reply.	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	1.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	348.00
459800	5/5/2010	TIME	WIP Review of docket and legal research re: deadlines for appeals for motion to dismiss (.3) and objection to procedures order (.3).	JWG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR MOTION TO DISMISS	0.00 0.00	290.00 T@13	0.00
Total: MOTION TO DISMISS				Billable	102.20		35178.50
				Unbillable	0.80		292.00
				Total	103.00		35470.50
<u>Nickname 1: NORTHSIDE COMMUNITY BANK</u>							
468516	1/14/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with L. Natchinson re: Lubanko and Iron Horse leases (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
444171	1/25/2010	TIME	WIP Phone call from T. Magill re: Northside Community Bank leasing issues	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
444239	1/26/2010	TIME	WIP	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR	0.10 0.00	475.00 T@13	47.50

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 205

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Discuss NorthSide Bank leasing issues with A. Guon	NORTHSIDE COMMUN			
447790	2/16/2010	TIME	WIP Examined Northside motion to conduct 2004 examinations (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
447809	2/16/2010	TIME	WIP Review trustees 2004 authority motion	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	95.00
447805	2/16/2010	TIME	WIP Review Northside Bank 2004 Exam motion of Debtor	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.30 0.00	475.00 T@13	142.50
447847	2/17/2010	TIME	WIP Examined motion for NorthSide 2004 Examination of the Debtor (.2); conference with L. Natchinson re: same (.1); examined revised rider to NorthSide subpoena (.1); email to and from B. Purcell re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
468550	2/18/2010	TIME	WIP Emails to and from R. Elli re: NorthSide Amended 2004 (.2); emails to and from L. Natchinson re: same (.1)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
448177	2/20/2010	TIME	WIP Review amended Northside Bank Rule 2004 motion	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	95.00
449226	2/26/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with L. Natchinson re: NorthSide claim and subpoena (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
450113	3/2/2010	TIME	WIP Review Susqhuehana/Northside motion re: Iron Horse lease.	IB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR NORTHSIDE COMMUN	0.20 0.00	475.00 T@13	95.00



7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 206

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
	Posting Status	Client Matter		Bill Status	
	Description				
468569	TIME	AJG	0.50	380.00	190.00
	3/8/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Review tax returns for response to NorthSide Subpoena (.5)	NORTHSIDE COMMUN			
468570	TIME	AJG	0.10	380.00	38.00
	3/10/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Email to and from L. Natchinson and to R. Elli re: control agreement for PF Funding (.1)	NORTHSIDE COMMUN			
469856	TIME	AJG	0.20	380.00	76.00
	3/10/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Response to NorthSide 2004 examination.	NORTHSIDE COMMUN			
Total: NORTHSIDE COMMUNITY BANK					
		Billable	3.50		1453.50
		Unbillable	0.00		0.00
		Total	3.50		1453.50
<u>Nickname 1: PREFERENCES</u>					
443305	TIME	MLS	0.30	245.00	73.50
	1/4/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Meet with A. Guon re preference adversaries	PREFERENCES			
443308	TIME	MLS	1.20	245.00	294.00
	1/5/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Draft Askounis & Darcy preference adversary	PREFERENCES			
445183	TIME	AJG	1.10	380.00	418.00
	1/5/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Email to J. Brand re: Askounis turnover motion (.2); conference with J. Brand re: same (.2); revised preference complaint against Askounis (.5); reviewed claims filed by Askounis (.2).	PREFERENCES			
445190	TIME	AJG	0.30	380.00	114.00
	1/6/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			
	Examined documents supporting Askounis preference (.2); email to and from I. Irwin re: same (.1).	PREFERENCES			
467137	TIME	AJG	0.40	380.00	152.00
	1/7/2010	Legal Services	0.00	T@13	
	WIP	LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR			

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 207

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
			Revised preference complaint against Askunaise Darcy (.4)	PREFERENCES			
443320	1/8/2010	TIME	WIP Revise and file IFC adversary against Askounis and Darcy	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.40 0.00	245.00 T@13	98.00
443324	1/11/2010	TIME	WIP Revise complaint and file amended complaint	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.30 0.00	245.00 T@13	73.50
467143	1/11/2010	TIME	WIP Reviewed Askonis complaint, invoices and checks in response to Askounis position (.2)	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
443494	1/20/2010	TIME	WIP Email correspondence with J. Brand regarding Tak Byun and Kyon Dong Industries preference actions and preference analysis generally.	GEG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.20 0.00	290.00 T@13	58.00
446962	2/9/2010	TIME	WIP Consider preference issues in the context of prepetition residual release in favor of secured lender and confer with A. Guon on same.	PJR Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.40 0.00	450.00 T@13	180.00
468546	2/17/2010	TIME	WIP Review docket for time of Askounis adversary status (.1)	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.10 0.00	245.00 T@13	24.50
448798	2/25/2010	TIME	WIP Court appearance for status hearing on Askounis adversary (.3).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
453414	3/3/2010	TIME	WIP Conference call with B. Purcell, R. Elli re First Chicago preference transfers	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.40 0.00	245.00 T@13	98.00

7/30/2010  
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
 Slip Listing

Page 208

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
459578	TIME		4/19/2010 WIP Draft Askounis and Darcy Initial disclosures	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.90 0.00	245.00 T@13	220.50
459625	TIME		4/30/2010 WIP Revise Askounis and Darcy initial disclosures	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.30 0.00	245.00 T@13	73.50
460550	TIME		5/12/2010 WIP Reviewed and edited A&D discovery requests.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.80 0.00	380.00 T@13	304.00
464284	TIME		5/12/2010 WIP Draft Askounis & Darcy discovery request.	MLS Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	1.20 0.00	245.00 T@13	294.00
460557	TIME		5/13/2010 WIP Reviewed and edited further versions of discovery requests to A&D.	TGB Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
461036	TIME		5/20/2010 WIP Conference with T. Askounis re: settlement (.4).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
461384	TIME		5/24/2010 WIP Email to T. Askounis re: settlement (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
465072	TIME		6/15/2010 WIP Conference with A. Darcy re: settlement discussion (.3); email to D. Leibowitz re: same (.1).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
465228	TIME		6/16/2010 WIP Conference with A. Darcy re: settlement of preference (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR PREFERENCES	0.20 0.00	380.00 T@13	76.00
Total: PREFERENCES				Billable	10.20		3197.50

7/30/2010  
3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
Slip Listing

Page 209

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
				Unbillable	0.00		0.00
				Total	10.20		3197.50
<u>Nickname 1: SUSQUEHANNA</u>							
467261	11/16/2009	TIME	WIP Conference with M. Leiberman re: Susquannah lease issues (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.20 0.00	365.00 T@14	73.00
462416	5/27/2010	TIME	WIP Email from S. Csar re: Susquehanna leases	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
463400	6/2/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with M. Leiberman re: settlement issues (.5).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.40 0.00	380.00 T@13	152.00
463884	6/3/2010	TIME	WIP Conference with M. Leiberman re: Susquehanna leases (.5).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00
464042	6/4/2010	TIME	WIP Conferences (2) with B. Purcell and R. Elli re: preparation for call with Susquehanna (.7); Conference with M. Leiberman and Susquehanna representative and IFC staff re: settlement (.9);	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	1.60 0.00	380.00 T@13	608.00
464764	6/10/2010	TIME	WIP Email to and from M. Lieberman re: status of reconciliation	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
464986	6/14/2010	TIME	WIP Examined end of lease data for May and June from Susquehanna (.1); conference with M. Leiberman re: reconciliation status (.2).	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.30 0.00	380.00 T@13	114.00
465161	6/16/2010	TIME	WIP conference with S. Hemdon re: same (.1);	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.50 0.00	380.00 T@13	190.00

7/30/2010  
 3:36 PM

SHAW GUSSIS FISHMAN GLANTZ WOLFSON & TOWBIN LLC  
 Slip Listing

Page 210

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	Attorney Activity Client Matter	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
conference with M. Lieberman and S. Hemdon re: Susquehanna reconciliation (.4)							
465571	TIME	6/21/2010	WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
Conference with M. Lieberman re: settlement (.1).							
465757	TIME	6/23/2010	WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
Emails to and from M. Lieberman re: Susquehanna reconciliation issues (.1).							
466454	TIME	6/29/2010	WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.10 0.00	380.00 T@13	38.00
Email to and M. Lieberman re: issues to discuss with clients at tomorrow's conference (.1).							
468158	TIME	6/30/2010	WIP	AJG Legal Services LEIBOWITZ, D/IFC CR SUSQUEHANNA	0.90 0.00	380.00 T@13	342.00
Conference with P. Purcell, B. Engelhardt and M. Lieberman (.5); further conference with M. Lieberman re: additional settlement discussions (.2); conference with D. Liebowitz re: update on settlement (.2).							
Total: SUSQUEHANNA							
				Billable	4.90		1859.00
				Unbillable	0.00		0.00
				Total	4.90		1859.00
Grand Total							
				Billable	1953.20		685015.00
				Unbillable	6.30		2352.00
				Total	1959.50		687367.00